Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

Hi Denise,

2020 SPRAYPAINTING <2020spraypainting@gmail.com>
Wednesday, 14 July 2021 11:15 AM

Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Re: SBR 173R TP AXA

SBR173R - FINALISATION CONFIRMATION.pdf

Please find attached for the acceptance on the finalisation of SBR173R.

Thank You.
Regards,
SHAH
Admin of

2020 SPRAY PAINTING PTE LTD.

H/p: 97166502

Email: 2020spraypainting@gmail.com

On Wed, Jul 14, 2021 at 11:08 AM Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

Finalise @ Lump Sum $3300,4days.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



