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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 31 March 2022 10:52 AM
To: Hua Meng
Subject: RE: AXA INSURED: S1M03BL1 (SHC8611Z)   OUR REF: SH2807J     D.O.A: 09.06.2021
Attachments: DS FORM_SH2807J.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with your client authorisation to act to us (LKK) for our 
necessary action. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 
From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>  
Sent: Thursday, 31 March 2022 9:44 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: AXA INSURED: S1M03BL1 (SHC8611Z) OUR REF: SH2807J D.O.A: 09.06.2021 
 
Dear Xiao Tong 
 
We refer to your email below. 
Kindly let us have the DV. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Regards, 
Jing Yee 
Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop 
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1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, 
BLK C #01-34/#01-61 
Singapore 417883 
Tel: 6746 5519 
Fax: 6743 4896 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Monday, 28 March 2022 4:45 PM 
To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: AXA INSURED: S1M03BL1 (SHC8611Z) OUR REF: SH2807J D.O.A: 09.06.2021 
 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
We refer to your below email. 
 
We are prepared to revise our offer at a global sum of $5,450.00(all-in). 
 
Please confirm acceptance. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 
From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 25 March 2022 5:17 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: AXA INSURED: S1M03BL1 (SHC8611Z) OUR REF: SH2807J D.O.A: 09.06.2021 
 
Dear Xiao Tong 
 
We counter proposed $6,000.00 (all-in). 
Kindly revert. 

 

Thank You. 
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Regards, 

Jing Yee 

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C 

#01-34/#01-61 

Singapore 417883 

Tel : 6746 5519        Fax : 6743 4896 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Friday, March 25, 2022 4:40 PM 
To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: AXA INSURED: S1M03BL1 (SHC8611Z) OUR REF: SH2807J D.O.A: 09.06.2021  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Hi Jing Yee, 
  
As spoken, kindly let us have your counter propose amount for our further action. 
  
Thank you. 
  
  
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 25 March 2022 2:11 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: AXA INSURED: S1M03BL1 (SHC8611Z) OUR REF: SH2807J D.O.A: 09.06.2021 
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Hi Xiao Tong 
  
Please assist to let us have the update. 

  

Thank You. 

  

  

Regards, 

Jing Yee 

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C 

#01-34/#01-61 

Singapore 417883 

Tel : 6746 5519        Fax : 6743 4896 
  

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, February 21, 2022 3:00 PM 
To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: AXA INSURED: S1M03BL1 (SHC8611Z) OUR REF: SH2807J D.O.A: 09.06.2021  
  
Dear Jaslin, 
  
We refer to your email dated 14.02.2022. 
We reject the offer. 
Kindly revert. 

  

Thank You. 

  

  

Regards, 

Jing Yee 

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C 

#01-34/#01-61 
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Singapore 417883 

Tel : 6746 5519        Fax : 6743 4896 
  

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, February 14, 2022 2:43 PM 
To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: AXA INSURED: S1M03BL1 (SHC8611Z) OUR REF: SH2807J D.O.A: 09.06.2021  
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE  
  
 Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
  
 We refer to the above matter. 
  
 We propose settlement at a global sum of $ 5,200.00 (all-in). 
  
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
  
Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  
From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Monday, 14 February 2022 10:48 AM 
To: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg> 
Subject: RE: AXA INSURED: S1M03BL1 (SHC8611Z) OUR REF: SH2807J D.O.A: 09.06.2021 
  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Dear Sir / Madam,  

  

We are currently still pending mandate approval from our principal, shall revert to you once approved. 

  
  
"Wishing You Happiness & Prosperity Chinese New Year 2022" 
  
Thank you. 
Best Regards, 
Jaslin Kok | Case Handler  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>  
Sent: Saturday, 12 February 2022 11:51 AM 
To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: AXA INSURED: S1M03BL1 (SHC8611Z) OUR REF: SH2807J D.O.A: 09.06.2021 
Importance: High 
  
Dear Jaslin, 
  
We refer to our LOD sent on 07/01/2022. 
We had yet to get your reply. 
Kindly let us have the offer soonest. 
  

Thank You. 

  

  

Regards, 

Jing Yee 

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C 

#01-34/#01-61 

Singapore 417883 

Tel : 6746 5519        Fax : 6743 4896 
  

From: Hua Meng 
Sent: Friday, January 7, 2022 3:14 PM 
To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: lkk claims <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: AXA INSURED: S1M03BL1 (SHC8611Z) OUR REF: SH2807J D.O.A: 09.06.2021  
  
Dear Sir 
  
Kindly refer to the LOD, video footage, and relevant documents attached for your review. 
Kindly let us have the offer soonest. 

  

Thank You. 

  

  

Regards, 
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Jing Yee 

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 Blk C 

#01-34/#01-61 

Singapore 417883 

Tel : 6746 5519        Fax : 6743 4896 
  


