Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 2 December 2021 9:19 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: FINALISE SKX6175H / BEFORE PAINT

Hi Shiau Chan,

Case finalised

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

574 74

RERER W Sve the Larthe Print only whern necessary:

From: sharon@sngahtee.com [mailto:sharon@sngahtee.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 1 December, 2021 2:13 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FINALISE SKX6175H / BEFORE PAINT

Hi Rasul

Amount confirm.
Thanks.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHT

MOTOR & PAMEL'SE

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@|kkauto.com>
Sent: Wednesday, December 1, 2021 10:07 AM




To: sharon@sngahtee.com
Subject: RE: FINALISE SKX6175H / BEFORE PAINT

Hi Sharon,

Audit checked part price for headlamp slightly high, necessary adjustment required
Finalised amount is $ 6,206.94 / 5 days of P/P repair
Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
¥ ESES

SERER WWT Suve the Larthe Print only when necessary

From: sharon@sngahtee.com [mailto:sharon@sngahtee.com]
Sent: Thursday, 25 November, 2021 5:23 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: FINALISE SKX6175H / BEFORE PAINT

Hi Rasul

Please check & confirm.
Thanks.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHT

MOTOR & PAMELS




