Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 23 June 2021 1:37 PM

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: 50113430 / SHD8618A - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo . (DOA:
07/06/2021)

From: Taxis Customer Service <taxiscs@stengg.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 23 June 2021 1:37:16 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>; claims@dingautomotive.com
<claims@dingautomotive.com>; kelly.ding@dingauto.sg <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; sarah@dingautomotive.com
<sarah@dingautomotive.com>

Subject: RE: 50113430 / SHD8618A - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo . (DOA: 07/06/2021)

Dear Rasul,
Noted.

Thanks for your helping.

Thank You
Best Regards,

Guwwlg/
Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
Hp : 93299929

Office : 62657130

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, June 23, 2021 9:08 AM

To: Taxis Customer Service <taxiscs@stengg.com>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 50113430 / SHD8618A - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo . (DOA: 07/06/2021)

#* WARNING! THIS EMAIL ORIGINATES FROM OUTSIDE ST ENGINEERING. **%*
Do not click on links or attachments if you are unsure of the source.
Hi Guang,

Finalised amount of $ 2,700 / 3 days of lump sum repair is confirmed

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

F EFES e
SemmEm mww Save the Larthe Print only wherr necessary-

From: Taxis Customer Service [mailto:taxiscs@stengg.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 22 June, 2021 7:44 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Motor Claims; Kelly Ding; Sarah Ong

Subject: RE: 50113430 / SHD8618A - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo . (DOA: 07/06/2021)

Dear Rasul,
Kindly refer attached.
We had requested item Front RH Headlamp (item no.10 in estimate) LIST PRICE from our supplier.

List Price (Before -20%)
Front RH Headlamp - $ 1,908.10

Shall can we re-finalize at $ 2,700.00 L/S repair?
As per calculated :

Labour = $930.00

S/N =S 240.00

Parts=$ 2,206.68

L+S+P =$3.376.68 — 20% L/S
Total =$2,701.34

Lump Sum = $ 2,700.00

Thank You
Best Regards,

Guang

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd
Hp 1 93299929

Office': 62657130

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, June 22, 2021 3:19 PM

To: Taxis Customer Service <taxiscs@stengg.com>

Subject: RE: 50113430 / SHD8618A - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo . (DOA: 07/06/2021)

* WARNING! THIS EMAIL ORIGINATES FROM OUTSIDE ST ENGINEERING. **%*
Do not click on links or attachments if you are unsure of the source.

Hi Guang,



As spoken,

Audit check part prices high.
Finalised amount is $ 2,450 / 3 days of lump sum repair
Kindly confirm

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
¥ ESLS

SERER WWTT Suve the Larthe Print only when necessary

From: Taxis Customer Service [mailto:taxiscs@stengg.com]

Sent: Friday, 18 June, 2021 7:23 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: claims@dingautomotive.com; kelly.ding@dingauto.sg; sarah@dingautomotive.com
Subject: 50113430 / SHD8618A - Finalize Amount & After Repair Photo . (DOA: 07/06/2021)

Without Prejudice

Dear Rasul,
Please see below for the finalize according to our conversation to finalize for SHD8618A.

Please refer attachment Estimate & After Paint for SHD8618A.

Lump Sum Repair

Total Repair — 03 Days

Labour = $ 930.00

S/N =5 240.00

Parts=$2,531.91

L+S+P =$ 3,701.91 — 20% lump sum

Total Finalize Amount = $ 2,961.53.

Thanks!
Best Regards,

Guang

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd



Hp : 93299929
Office : 62657130
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