Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 June 2021 1:20 am
To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: FINALISATION OF SMK1146U

From: Lim Jonathan <jonathan@satsg.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 June 2021 1:19:24 AM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ilkkauto.com>; Shien Lee <shien@satsg.sg>; 'claims@satsg.sg'
<Claims@satsg.sg>; 'John Lim' <john@dreamselection.net>; terence@satsg.sg <terence@satsg.sg>
Subject: Re: FINALISATION OF SMK1146U

Thanks for the speedy Finalisation.
We accept the repair cost finalisation. Please kindly close this case on your end.
We will submit the LOD accordingly.

Please let me know who is the OIC in charge and the email address to whom I can address the LOD from
the insurers side.

From: "Taufikh (LKK Auto)" <taufikh@Ilkkauto.com>
Organisation: LKK Auto

Date: Monday, 7 June 2021 at 12:34 PM

To: 'Lim Jonathan' <jonathan@satsg.sg>

Cc: "'Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)"" <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: FINALISATION OF SMK1146U

Hi Jonathan,
Refer attached, COR |/s$3450, 4 days.
Regards

Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Lim Jonathan [mailto:jonathan@satsg.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 20 May 2021 1:27 AM



To: taufikh@lkkauto.com
Subject: RE: FINALISATION OF SMK1146U

Good day Mr Taufikh ,
Hope my email find you well. Attached is the Cost Estimate for your esteem assessment and mark down.
Date of Release car back to Client:

Attached documents:

¢ Cost Estimate.
e After Repair Pictures.

Please assist me to finalised as this case is dated first quarter of 2021. I hope to hear from you soonest.

Jonathan Lim,

Head, Claim Department
SAT(SG) Pte Ltd

61 Ubi Road 1 #04-14

Oxley Bizhub Singapore 408727
Mobile: (65) 9126 9987

Email: Jonathan@satsg.sg



