8/5/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: SMV5339X Final // LKK Ref: CC4/11121006457/T1pa3

Xin Yun Auto <xinyunauto1@gmail.com>
Thu 5/8/2021 4:.07 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Hi Hsiao Tong and Taufikh,

Thanks for your email, will use your marking as SJE marking, this case previously got lawyer, PRI
was from law firm.
Thus we will submit to lawyer to follow up on LOD and chase payment from insurance.

Again, thank you so much,
Best Regards,
Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto

Tel/Fax:6634 0858

Mobile: 9839 1555
Email:xinyunautol @gmail.com

On Thu, Aug 5, 2021 at 4:03 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Further to the below email.

Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental
receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

Please note that all the finalisation subject to insurer approval.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on

the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Xin Yun Auto <xinyunautol@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 28 July 2021 1:07 PM
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@Ikkauto.com>
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Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: SMV5339X Final

Thanks Taufikh, we accept and thank you.

Best Regards

Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto

Tel/Fax:6634 0858

Mobile: 9839 1555
Email:xinyunauto1@gmail.com

Virus-free. www.avast.com

On Wed, Jul 28, 2021 at 12:54 PM Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Yi Xin,

Refer attached, COR I/s $6450, 7 days.

Subject to insurance approval

Regards
Taufikh

Lkk Auto

From: Xin Yun Auto [mailto:xinyunautol @gmail.com]
Sent: Friday, 18 June 2021 4:55 PM

To: Taufikh (LKK Auto)

Subject: SMV5339X Final

Dear Taufikh, fy... SMV5339X final pictures for you, thanks alot.

Best Regards,
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Yi Xin

Xin Yun Auto
Tel/Fax:6634 0858
Mobile: 9839 1555

Email:xinyunauto1 @gmail.com

I:I Virus-free. www.avast.com
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