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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Thursday, 2 June 2022 10:59 AM
To: yeeauto pteltd
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: #0892741799SG003#027#ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. SMQ57T & 

SKQ9981P ON 04 JUNE 2021 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21006447/Krs3
Attachments: DV_SMQ 57T.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 
from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 
  
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 1 June 2022 5:20 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: #0892741799SG003#027#ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. SMQ57T & SKQ9981P ON 04 JUNE 2021 
*** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21006447/Krs3 
 
Good day Hsiao Tong 
 
We accept the amount $6600 
 
Thanks & Regards 
 
Winni 
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Yee Auto Pte Ltd 
160 Sin Ming Drive 
#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity 
Singapore 575722 
ROC & GST No.: 201719251W 
email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com 
Contact No: 6457 2625  Fax: 6252 8459 
 
 
On Wed, 1 Jun 2022 at 14:54, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/mdm, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We propose settlement at a global sum of $6,600.00(all-in). 

  

Please confirm acceptance. 

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 
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Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

  

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 26 May 2022 10:33 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: #0892741799SG003#027#ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. SMQ57T & SKQ9981P ON 04 JUNE 2021 
*** LKK REF: CC4/AIG21006447/Krs3 

  

Good day Hsiao 

  

Attached video and photo 

  

Thanks 

Winni 

Yee Auto Pte Ltd 

160 Sin Ming Drive 

#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity 

Singapore 575722 

ROC & GST No.: 201719251W 

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com 

Contact No: 6457 2625  Fax: 6252 8459 
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On Wed, 25 May 2022 at 15:08, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 

  

Attached is a copy of our insured accident report for your easy reference. 

  

We would like to request for evidences (ie: video footage/ scene photos / PIR) for our necessary action. 

  

Appreciate an early reply. 

  

  

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of 
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / 
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

  

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the 
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.” 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |  

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 26 April 2022 2:22 PM 
To: Claims Admin Support <ClaimsAdminSupport@aig.com> 
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Subject: [EXTERNAL] ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. SMQ57T & SKQ9981P ON 04 JUNE 2021 ALONG 
TAMPINES AVE 3 TOWARDS AVE 8 

  

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

  

We enclose herewith copies of the following to substantiate and confirm the settlement:- 

  

Attached repair bill 

  

Thanks & Regards 

  

Jia Li 

Yee Auto Pte Ltd 

160 Sin Ming Drive 

#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity 

Singapore 575722 

ROC & GST No.: 201719251W 

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com 

Contact No: 6457 2625  Fax: 6252 8459 

IMPORTANT NOTICE:  
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, 
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please 
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or 
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other 
defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility 
of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International 
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any 
way from its use. 


