Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 August 2021 10:28 am

To: '‘Derek Oh'

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SMG8507L FINALIZATION

Attachments: SMG8507L FINALIZATION.pdf; SMG 8507 marking .pdf
Hi Derek,

COR $3112.30, 3 days

Regards
Taufikh
Lkk Auto

From: Derek Oh [mailto:derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 29 July 2021 12:10 PM

To: taufikh@lkkauto.com

Cc: Stephanie Loke; Tommy Woon Wui Tew; Jess Francis Carlos; Eric Paul Glorioso; Tan Wei Cin; Yvonne Chew; Ng
Mei Yen; Sonia Teo

Subject: SMG8507L FINALIZATION

Dear Taufikh,

Our COR computation is attached for your agreement.

COR: $ 3,112.30 before GST.

3 repair days (not including preparation of estimate, wait for survey/authorization/spare parts, Sat/Sun/PH).

Kindly confirm the above as soon as possible.

Best Regards.

Derek Oh

Insurance Claims Executive

27A Tanjong Penjuru, Singapore 609042

T: (65) 6331 0680 D: (65) 6331 0684 F: (65) 6331 0690

E: derek.oh@eurokars.com.sg W: www.eurokarsgroup.com




