Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Attachments:

Dear Shiau Chan,

Anthony Chey <anthonychey@cheyllc.com>

Monday, 14 June 2021 11:55 am

Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

assignments; 'kuldip@crossbordersllc.com’; '‘Corene Chong'; 'Abdul Aziz Bin
Sulaiman’; SUR

RE: APPOINTMENT OF SINGLE JOINT EXPERT FOR GZ9397B: MC/MC SUIT NO.
12319/2020 - CrossBorders Ref: AJ.tk.6795.2019.KC.PD - Chey Ref: AC.2020.041
Amended STATEMENT_OF_CLAIM.pdf; XD5181Y (Ol).pdf

This is a side to side chain collision along the expressway. GZ9397B (the Plaintiff) was travelling along Lane 2 whilst
XD5181Y (the Defendant) was travelling along Lane 4. SBS3062C was travelling along Lane 3 (between the GZ9397B
and XD5181Y) and motorcycle JSD9497 was travelling along Lane 1.

Attached are the following documents:

1. Plaintiff’s Amended Statement of Claim.

2. Report by XD5181Y.

Please obtain the other reports from the Plaintiff’s solicitors.

Best Regards,

Anthony Chey % IE{%
Managing Director

Chey LLC

DID +65 6428 8247, Mobile +65 9674 9094

anthonychey@cheyllc.com

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, June 14, 2021 10:35 AM

To: Anthony Chey <anthonychey@cheyllc.com>

Cc: assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; 'kuldip@crossborderslic.com' <kuldip@crossbordersllc.com>;
'Corene Chong' <corene@crossborderslic.com>; 'Abdul Aziz Bin Sulaiman' <aziz@crossborderslic.com>; SUR

<sur@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: APPOINTMENT OF SINGLE JOINT EXPERT FOR GZ9397B: MC/MC SUIT NO. 12319/2020 - CrossBorders
Ref: AJ.tk.6795.2019.KC.PD - Chey Ref: AC.2020.041

Dear Anthony,

Kindly provide us the both party GIA report.

Thank you.
Best Regards,
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315



Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Anthony Chey <anthonychey@cheyllc.com>

Sent: Monday, 7 June, 2021 11:38 AM

To: Summer (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; assignments@I|kkauto.com

Cc: Kuldip Singh <kuldip@crossborderslic.com>; Corene Chong <corene@crossborderslic.com>; Abdul Aziz Bin
Sulaiman <aziz@crossbordersllc.com>

Subject: APPOINTMENT OF SINGLE JOINT EXPERT FOR GZ9397B: MC/MC SUIT NO. 12319/2020 - CrossBorders Ref:
AJ.tk.6795.2019.KC.PD - Chey Ref: AC.2020.041

Dear Sir/Mdm,

| act for the Defendants (XD5181Y) whilst Ascentsia Law Corporation acts for the Plaintiff (GZ9397B) in MC/MC
12319/2020.

Pursuant to the Order of Court dated 4 June 2021, Mr Xing Guo Qiang of LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd is appointed
as the Single Joint Expert for MC/MC 12319/2020 to do the necessary work and produce an SJE report in respect of
the cost of repairs for GZ9397B.

Both parties will each pay 50% of the SJE bill. Please issue separate bills to:-

1. CrossBorders LLC.
2. Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd care of Chey LLC (please bill directly to Sompo Insurance).

The Plaintiff and Defendant did not appoint surveyors. The survey of GZ9397B was conducted by Quantum Risk
Management under the instruction of SBS Transit Ltd. The QRM survey report recommended lump sum cost of
repairs at $18,550.00 and 14 working days for the repairs to be carried out. However, the QRM surveyor also stated
that the economical repair limit is about $5,946.00.

Attached are the following documents:-

1. Quantum Risk Management survey report.

Please liaise with CrossBorders LLC on the physical re-inspection of SKD2211T, if required.

Best Regards,

Anthony Chey# IE{%
Managing Director

Chey LLC

DID +65 6428 8247, Mobile +65 9674 9094
anthonychey@cheyllc.com

Chey LLC
20 Havelock Road #02-47 Singapore 059765 Tel +65 6428 8247 Fax +65 6428 8342.

This email is sent for and on behal of Chey LLC (UEN No. 201729193N), a Singapore law practice registered under the Companies Act (Chapter 50) and is an
exempt private company limited by shares.

This email (and any attachment) is confidential. If it not addressed to you, please do not read, disclose, copy or forward it on, but notify the sender immediately
and delete it. Any legal advice in the message may be privileged and not disclosable in any court action. We have tried to ensure this email does not contain
any viruses, but please check this before opening any attachments, as we cannot accept any responsibility for damage caused by a virus. Please note that we
may intercept, monitor and store emails for the purposes of ensuring compliance with law, our policies and for audit purposes.

Fraudsters are increasingly targeting law firms and their clients often requesting funds to be transferred to a different bank account or seeking to obtain
confindential information. If you receive a suspicious or unexpected email from us, or purporting to have been sent on our behalf, please do not reply to the
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email, click on any links, open any attachments, or comply with any instructions contained within it. Instead, please telephone us to verify the email. Chey LLC
cannot take responsibility for any losses arising from your transfer of funds or disclosure of confidential information.



