Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 June 2021 1:45 PM

To: Sim, Priscilla-LK; SUR

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); Naz (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Re: Fwd: FW: Letter of Undertaking - YP4939K
Dear Ms Sim,

Kindly approved in merimen.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK [mailto:Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com]

Sent: Thursday, 17 June 2021 1:38 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@Ikkauto.com>; Naz (LKKAuto) <Naz@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Re: Fwd: FW: Letter of Undertaking - YP4939K

Hi

Kindly inform repair to proceed with repair immediately.

By copy to Naz, kindly let us have final report once available.

Priscilla Sim LK
Senior Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building 78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755
priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg




From: Sim, Priscilla-LK

Sent: Thursday, June 17, 2021 1:34 PM

To: Irene Ng <khc@kimhockchye.com>

Cc: Soon, Joyce-WW <Joyce-WW.Soon@aig.com>

Subject: RE: [EXTERNAL] Re: Fwd: FW: Letter of Undertaking - YP4939K

HI Irene
Thank you for re-send document.

Will authorized repair immediately.

Priscilla Sim LK
Senior Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building 78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755
priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Irene Ng <khc@kimhockchye.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 17, 2021 1:30 PM

To: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Re: Fwd: FW: Letter of Undertaking - YP4939K

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Priscilla,

Here you go!

Best regards,
lrene Ng (&%)

Manager
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389A Balestier Road S(329796)
Tel: 62538288 Fax: 62560787 HP: 97281193

We provide these General Insurance services:

Performance Bond / Project Insurance / Workmen Compensation Insurance /Foreign worker Bond & Medical Insurance / Contractor
All Risk / Motor Insurance / Motor Fleet Insurance.

Visit our website https://www.khc-holdings.com/ for more services and get a quote now!

Please consider the environment before printing this email

On Thu, Jun 17, 2021 at 11:23 AM Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com> wrote:

Hi lrene

Thank you for e-mail, kindly re-send copy with the company rubber stamp in the undertaking letter.

Priscilla Sim LK
Senior Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building 78 Shenton Way, Level 10

Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755



priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Irene Ng <khc@kimhockchye.com>

Sent: Thursday, June 17, 2021 10:42 AM

To: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>

Cc: Soon, Joyce-WW <Joyce-WW.Soon@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Fwd: FW: Letter of Undertaking - YP4939K

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Priscilla,

Please find the sign undertaking letter attached.

Thank you.

Best regards,

lrene Ng (3T %)

Manager
ICHOLDINGS

389A Balestier Road S(329796)
Tel: 62538288 Fax: 62560787 HP: 97281193

We provide these General Insurance services:

Performance Bond / Project Insurance / Workmen Compensation Insurance /Foreign worker Bond & Medical Insurance / Contractor
All Risk / Motor Insurance / Motor Fleet Insurance.

Visit our website https://www.khc-holdings.com/ for more services and get a quote now!

Please consider the environment before printing this email



—————————— Forwarded message ---------
From: Joyce <joyce@alantac.com.sg>
Date: Thu, Jun 17, 2021 at 10:34 AM
Subject: FW: Letter of Undertaking

To: Irene Ng <khc@kimhockchye.com>

Dear Irene,

Attached Letter of Undertaking signed for your necessary action.

| have received call from LKK-Naz yesterday and have send him a copy of the latest servicing report.

Hope to hear from them on the latest update soon.

Thanks and regards,

Joyce

Alantac Industrial Services Pte Ltd
Blk 3016A Ubi Road 1

#01-07 S408707

Tel : 68420075

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not
use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply"
command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any
attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is



accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or
damage arising in any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you
must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify
me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this
email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free
and no responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either
jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



