












Land Transport Authority
10 Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701

GST Registration No. : M4-0006529-2

Print Date/Time : 02 Jun 2021 / 15:41:26

Receipt Date/Time : 02 Jun 2021 / 15:41:16

Tax Invoice/Receipt

Receipt No. : ITNET-00000-210602-002869

Previous Receipt No. :

S/N Item Description/
Business Transaction Reference 
No.

Amount 
Before

GST (S$)

GST 
Amount 

(S$)

Amount 
After GST 

(S$)
Result of Insurance Enquiry - GBF7777R
As at 01 Jun 2021/04:50:00
Insurance Co: AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

1 Insurance Enquiry - GBF7777R
Enquiry Fee 
20210602154001142749

7.00 0.49 7.49

Sub-Total 7.00 0.49 7.49

Total Before Rounding 7.00 0.49 7.49

Rounding Difference 0.04

Total Amount Payable 7.45

Paid By

423179XXXXXX2699 eNETS Credit Card 7.45

Total 7.45

Cash Change 0.00

Tendered Amount 7.45

Excess Refundable Amount 0.00

THANK YOU AND HAVE A NICE DAY!

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and promptly settled by the payment service 
provider / financial institution. Otherwise, the transaction and receipt is considered void and late fee 

may apply.
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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 28 June 2021 11:40 AM
To: HD
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 7777R(AIG) AND SGR 2849C ON 01/06/2021 @ 

16:50HRS ALONG/ AT JUNCTION OF TOH GUAN ROAD AND JURONG EAST 
CENTRAL

Attachments: GIA report(GBF7777R).PDF

Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Received with thanks. 
Attached is a copy of accident report for your record purpose. 
 
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, we are of the view that liability is not in your favour as it is a 
head-to-rear collision. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party. 
  
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact 
us within 07 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to this Third-Party 
claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will 
be protected. 
  
Please call us if you have further queries. 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: HD <finance.jiajiafu@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 23 June 2021 11:53 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: 回复: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 7777R(AIG) AND SGR 2849C ON 01/06/2021 @ 16:50HRS ALONG/ AT 
JUNCTION OF TOH GUAN ROAD AND JURONG EAST CENTRAL 
 
Hi, Hsiao Tong, 
 
Pls find the attachment for your reference, thank you very much. 
 
Xuexue Gao 
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发送自 Windows 10 版邮件应用 
 

发件人: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
发送时间: Tuesday, 22 June 2021 1:48 PM 
收件人: finance.jiajiafu@gmail.com 
主题: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 7777R(AIG) AND SGR 2849C ON 01/06/2021 @ 16:50HRS ALONG/ AT JUNCTION OF 
TOH GUAN ROAD AND JURONG EAST CENTRAL 
 
Hi XueXue, 
 
We are unable to accept the above docs for accident reporting. 
 
Kindly assist to let us have a copy of Insurance Certificate during the period of accident happened for our further 
action. 
 
Thanks. 
 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: JIAJIAFU <finance.jiajiafu@gmail.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 16 June 2021 3:51 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: 回复: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 7777R(AIG) AND SGR 2849C ON 01/06/2021 @ 16:50HRS ALONG/ AT 
JUNCTION OF TOH GUAN ROAD AND JURONG EAST CENTRAL 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong， 
Here attached our AIG insurance policy FYI, thank you very much. 
 
Gao Xuexue 
 
 
发送自 Windows 10 版邮件应用 
 

发件人: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
发送时间: 2021年6月10日 下午 2:39 
收件人: finance.jiajiafu@gmail.com 
主题: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 7777R(AIG) AND SGR 2849C ON 01/06/2021 @ 16:50HRS ALONG/ AT JUNCTION OF TOH 
GUAN ROAD AND JURONG EAST CENTRAL 
 
Our Ref: CC4/AIG21006359/Epa3 
  
M/s JIAJIAFU TRADING PTE. LTD. 
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Dear Sir, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBF 7777R(AIG) AND SGR 2849C ON 01/06/2021 @ 16:50HRS ALONG/ AT JUNCTION OF 
TOH GUAN ROAD AND JURONG EAST CENTRAL 
                 
We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been appointed to act on the behalf of your insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance 
Pte Ltd to settle a THIRD-PARTY claim against you for an accident which happened on the above-mentioned date 
and location. 
  
Our record shows that to date, you/your driver have not reported the accident to us. We would appreciate it if you 
could urgently file a report at any of AIG reporting centre. You may refer to your Certificate of Insurance for the list 
of the reporting centre. Attached is a copy of AIG Authorised Rpt Centre listing for your reference. 
  
To enable us to look into the matter immediately, please let us hear from you within fourteen (14) days from date of 
this letter (by 28 JUNE 2021).  
  
Please be reminded that in accordance with the terms and conditions under your policy, failure of compliance, our 
principal M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd reserves the right to repudiate liability.  
  
If you need further assistance or clarifications, please contact the undersigned. 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

  
  
 
 



11/11/21, 2:43 PM Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=1011391&extid=363342&CFID=89… 1/2

 

Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
03 Jun
2021
09:46

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> -. [A] LEE SU

THING

2
03 Jun
2021
09:46

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(201999) HONDA ACCORD 1.6 (M). [A] LEE SU
THING

3
03 Jun
2021
09:46

Clm Created Reg No: SGR2849C. Acct Date: 2021/06/01. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG). Workshop: Auburn Auto Pte Ltd (HQ)

[A] LEE SU
THING

4
03 Jun
2021
09:46

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] LEE SU

THING

5
03 Jun
2021
09:46

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/06/14 [A] LEE SU
THING

6
03 Jun
2021
09:46

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] LEE SU
THING

7
03 Jun
2021
09:46

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
(Express)

[A] Merimen
Administrator

8
03 Jun
2021
09:46

Label Added (20224):Field Survey. [A] Merimen
Administrator

9
03 Jun
2021
09:46

Label Added (62):PRI. [A] LEE SU
THING

10
03 Jun
2021
09:46

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> Lim Teow Guan [A] LEE SU
THING

11
03 Jun
2021
10:18

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

Lim Teow Guan -> CHEN TSUE YEE [A] LEE SU
THING

12
03 Jun
2021
17:55

Label
Removed (62):PRI. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

13
04 Jun
2021
15:13

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: - -> PARADIGM AUTO PTE LTD. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

14
04 Jun
2021
15:13

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(201999) -> (201172) TOYOTA WISH 1.8 (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

15
04 Jun
2021
16:19

Label Added (19):Fastlane. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

16
24 Jun
2021
08:48

Clm
Registration
Modified

Acct Time:00:00:00->16:50:00.

[I] AIG
OneClaim

Integration
User

17
28 Jun
2021
09:15

Clm
Registration
Modified

Acct Time:16:50:00->16:00:00. Pol No:1900231556-01->1900231556. [I] Low, Xianyu

18
07 Sep
2021
17:45

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

19
07 Sep
2021
17:45

Clm Dtl
Modified Insured ID: -> -. Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

20
07 Sep
2021
17:45

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2007/02/05.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

21
07 Sep
2021
17:45

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

22
01 Oct
2021
12:51

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:3307.45:Liability: 100%(b27)
*Quantum: (a)COR: $2,700.00 + (b)LOR(5days x $120.00):
$600.00 + (c)LTA/GIA search fee: $7.45 = Total: $3,307.45
*5recommendation repair days *For you
r approval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

23
13 Oct
2021
11:31

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/06/14. Mandate Remarks: please proceed with settlement @ $33
07.45[COR-$2700 LOR-$600 LTA/GIA:$7.45]**subject to final bill & ATA

[I] Syed-Yusoff,
Saliha

24
13 Oct
2021
11:31

Adj
Mandate
Set

Approved:3307.45:please proceed with settlement @ $3307.45[COR-$2700 LOR-$600 LTA/GIA:$7.4
5]**subject to final bill & ATA

[I] Syed-Yusoff,
Saliha

Date From       Date To       Audit Type None Go



ACTIVITY

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=89413250&CFTOKEN=2e80b3192246bf8c-7BC1B5F8-CC52-E041-0E0CDF4C2FDD661A&USID=3251&RID=8742000
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=89413250&CFTOKEN=2e80b3192246bf8c-7BC1B5F8-CC52-E041-0E0CDF4C2FDD661A&USID=3251&RID=8742000
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=89413250&CFTOKEN=2e80b3192246bf8c-7BC1B5F8-CC52-E041-0E0CDF4C2FDD661A&USID=3251&RID=8742000
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=89413250&CFTOKEN=2e80b3192246bf8c-7BC1B5F8-CC52-E041-0E0CDF4C2FDD661A&USID=3251&RID=8742000&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1011391%26extid%3D363342%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=89413250&CFTOKEN=2e80b3192246bf8c-7BC1B5F8-CC52-E041-0E0CDF4C2FDD661A&USID=3251&RID=8742000


11/11/21, 2:43 PM Merimen e-Claims

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_viewhistory&caseid=1011391&extid=363342&CFID=89… 2/2

[10/06/2021 14:39] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
OI PIC called back. They are aware of the accident but not yet do report. Advise her to get the driver make the report ASAP.
[10/06/2021 12:08] CHEW HSIAO TONG:
Called OI company at 67485200. PIC not around. Leave msg and get PIC to call back.
[04/06/2021 15:24] HOW MEI KWAN:
OINR. To send out first letter.



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2699115 03 Jun 2021
09:54:00

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SGR2849C GBF7777R 11.00

2723189 07 Sep 2021
17:45:17

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SGR2849C GBF7777R 11.00









