Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 28 July 2021 2:37 pm

To: SUR; CS A Team

Subject: FW: SLA 5386G Photos and Estimate, TP/ERGO, DOA: 23.05.2021

From: Chia Sin Muk <em1lautopteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 28 July 2021 2:36:52 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SLA 5386G Photos and Estimate, TP/ERGO, DOA: 23.05.2021

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Taufikh,
We confirmed Lumpsum COR $3,300 + 4 days.

Thanks & Best Regards,

Karen, on behalf of,

Chia Sin Muk (Mr)

m: (65) 9666 6556 | o: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643
Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R

On Wed, 28 Jul 2021 at 14:26, Taufikh (LKK Auto) <taufikh@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Mr Chia,

COR I/s $3300, 4 days.

Regards

Taufikh

Lkk Auto



From: Chia Sin Muk [mailto:em1autopteltd@gmail.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 22 June 2021 2:29 PM

To: Taufikh (LKKAuto); Team A

Subject: SLA 5386G Photos and Estimate, TP/ERGO, DOA: 23.05.2021

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir

L/S repair cost $3,300.00 + 4 days

Please find attached photos, kindly check and finalise.

Thanks & Best Regards,
Annie, on behalf of,
Chia Sin Muk (Mr)

m: (65) 9666 6556 | o: (65) 6452 3298 | f: (65) 6457 5776

EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 8 #01-68 Sin Ming Industrial Estate Sector C Singapore 575643

Co. / GST Registration Number: 201316380R



