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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Team AutoPro <tap.finalization@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 25 June 2021 6:32 pm

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Bryan Ang (LKKAuto); TG Lim (LKK Auto); SUR

Subject: Re: Finalisation of SLP 155K

Dear All , 

 

Without Prejudice 

   

Thank You for your prompt reply. 

 

We are pleased to confirm our acceptance to your proposed COR @ $4,950.00 & 05 Repair Days. 

 

Kindly advise OIC and reference number (if any) for our submission of LOD.(Ignore if already mentioned in the reply.) 

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall 

not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal 

injuries.* 
------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
Cheers, 
John Ko 
Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 
HP : 6258 1955 
Fax: 6258 1956 

 

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

 

 

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

 

On Fri, Jun 25, 2021 at 9:50 AM Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear John, 

  

Can confirm? 

  

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Saturday, 19 June 2021 12:33 PM 

To: Team AutoPro <tap.finalization@gmail.com> 

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>; Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) <bryanang@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: Finalisation of SLP 155K 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi, 

  

Attached is the amended estimate of  SLP 155K 

  

Amended COR is LS $ 4950.00 with 5 repair days subjected to the approval of the insurance company. 

Please send the LOD and all necessary documents to our Case Handler Ms Shiau Chan ASAP. 

  

NOTE: Please take note that this is our final offer and no more negotiation will be entertained.  

  

  

Best Regards, 

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants 

Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  TeowGuan@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

From: Team AutoPro [mailto:tap.finalization@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 17 June, 2021 11:55 AM 

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Bryan Ang (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: Finalisation of SLP 155K 
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Dear All, 

  

Attached are the prices from JAE. Kindly go through. 

  

Thank you for your kindness. 

  

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall 

not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his 

personal injuries.* 

------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 

Cheers, 

John Ko 

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 

HP : 6258 1955 

Fax: 6258 1956 

  

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

  

  

On Wed, Jun 16, 2021 at 5:48 PM TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi John, 

  

Please understand that we also have a list to follow and if you can observe, we followed the year model of the car. 

Thus the price tag adjusted is according to our list approved by the insurance company. 

We can use your price but it may be rejected by the insurance company. 
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Please provide a proper invoice and not hand-written quote. 

Incidentally, a couple of items are higher than you JAE list. 

  

Please provide a proper invoice before I can make any changes. 

  

Thanks. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants 

Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  TeowGuan@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

From: Team AutoPro [mailto:tap.finalization@gmail.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, 16 June, 2021 2:53 PM 

To: TG Lim (LKK Auto) 
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) 
Subject: Re: Finalisation of SLP 155K 

  

Dear Mr LIm, 

  

Attached are the prices from JAE. Kindly revise the pricing and revert back. 

  

Thank you.  

 

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall 

not prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his 

personal injuries.* 

------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------ 
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Cheers, 

John Ko 

Team AutoPro Pte Ltd 

HP : 6258 1955 

Fax: 6258 1956 

  

Main Office: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #02-12 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

Workshop/Survey Venue: 160 Sin Ming Dr,  #01-14 Sin Ming AutoCity Singapore 575722 

  

  

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  

On Wed, Jun 16, 2021 at 11:16 AM TG Lim (LKK Auto) <TeowGuan@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi, 

  

Attached is the adjusted estimate of SLP 155K 

  

Recommended COR is LS $4,450.00 with 5 repair days, subjected to the approval of the insurance company. 

Please send the LOD and all necessary documents to our Case Handler Ms Shiau Chan ASAP. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants 

Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  TeowGuan@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

To help protect your privacy, 
Micro so ft Office prevented  
auto matic downlo ad o f this  
picture from the Internet.

 

Virus-free. www.avg.com  

  


