










 

TAX INVOICE 

363 Sembawang Road 
Singapore 758379 
Tel: 67532536  Fax:67567565 
GST Reg No: 51-936900-M 

CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE 

GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LTD INVOICE  AR2106-0103:

:

:

:

:

AGREEMENT NO. 
ATTN : ACCOUNTS PAYABLE 

NO. 8 

SINGAPORE  638892 ELAINE
C.O.D

STAFF ID 
TERMS     
DATE       

TUAS AVE 18  
10/06/2021

HA202106-0018

DESCRIPTION   AMOUNT (SGD)

Vehicle Reg No 

Make / Model  NISSAN NV200 

Period 3 days 

Rental Rate 

 300.00: 

: 

: 

: 

Rental Dates : 

S$ 107.00 Per Day 

GBH5741X 

(Including GST) 

Rental Billing From 07/06/2021 To 10/06/2021 

Reference No : GBC2083H 

: 
: TAXABLE VALUE

NON-TAXABLE VALUE

THREE HUNDRED TWENTY-ONE DOLLARS ONLY 

: 
: GST 7%

 321.00

 21.00

AMOUNT : S$ 
 300.00

 0.00

TOTAL S$

Please make your cheques payable to : CHAN'S & SONS ENTERPRISE 

Payment Date 

CS / CC /CH 

CS / CC /CH 

F / Amt : 

: 

: 

For Official USe Only 
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>
Sent: Friday, 30 July 2021 9:09 AM
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto); Su Li (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A; MT_Claim_SG
Subject: RE: TP claim - Accident case between GBC2083H & XE3225M (your insured) on 

27/05/2021 @ 1135 hrs at Near 71 Tuas South Ave 1 Our Ref: 20/21/21/VC00/024604  
LKK REF : CC4/LP [External General]

Lonpac External - General 
Dear Cecilia 
 
Please proceed. 
 
Regards, 
Ong Li Li 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse  
Singapore 199555 
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
In view of the return to “Heightened Alert” Phase 2 on COVID-19 measures, more than 50% of 
our staff will be working from home from 22 July to 18 August 2021. Please expect delays in 
our replies, payments and claims settlements during this period. Your understanding is greatly 
appreciated and we apologise for any inconvenience caused. 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices. 
 
Lonpac External - General data is for internal / external use. 
 
From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Thursday, 29 July 2021 5:55 PM 
To: Su Li (LKK Auto) <suli@lkkauto.com>; ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: [WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED][WARNING: ATTACHMENT UNSCANNED]RE: TP claim - Accident case 
between GBC2083H & XE3225M (your insured) on 27/05/2021 @ 1135 hrs at Near 71 Tuas South Ave 1 Our Ref: 
20/21/21/VC00/024604 [External General] LKK REF : CC4/LPC... 
 

Lonpac Ref: 20/21/21/VC00/024604 

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21006263/Egs3 

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 
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We have highlighted to your good office on 10/06/2021 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

  

This is a head-to-rear collision. Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 

  

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “GOLDBELL ENGINEERING PTE LTD” is as follows: - 

  

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $    4,956.79 $ 2,033.00 
2. Loss of RENTALw/GST (3days x 
$107.00) 

$       321.00 $    321.00 (3days x $107.00) 

3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $          2.00 $        2.00 
Total $   5,279.79 $ 2,356.00 

  

**03days recommendation for repair  

  

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 

  

The above is for your approval. 

 
 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be 
made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any 
inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 


