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Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

From: Susan Lim/Fion Pee <kohlimmotoring@gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 22 July 2021 12:07 pm

To: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto)

Cc: TG Lim (LKK Auto); SUR

Subject: Re: Finalisation of SLN 8251Z

Dear Hui Zhen  
 
We confirmed L/S $450 / 3 repair days. 
 
The LOD report will follow shortly. 
 
Thank you 
Kane 
 
KOH & LIM MOTORING SERVICES 
 
 
On Wed, Jul 21, 2021 at 10:26 AM Hui Zhen (LKK Auto) <huizhen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Hi Sir/Mdm, 

  

Kindly confirm. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Hui Zhen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: huizhen@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: TG Lim (LKK Auto)  
Sent: Saturday, 17 July 2021 2:28 pm 
To: kohlimmotoring@gmail.com 
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Cc: Hui Zhen (LKK Auto) <huizhen@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Finalisation of SLN 8251Z 

  

Without Prejudice 

  

Hi, 

  

Attached is the adjusted estimate of SLN 8251Z 

  

Recommended COR is LS $450.00 with 3 repair days, subjected to the approval of the insurance company. 

Please send the LOD and all the necessary documents to our Case Handler Ms Hui Zhen ASAP. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

TG Lim | Automotive Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants 

Phone: 6256 3561| Email:  TeowGuan@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  


