Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: 2020 SPRAYPAINTING <2020spraypainting@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 15 June 2021 2:41 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SME 7320A-DOA: 28/5/21

Attachments: SME7320A - FINALISATION ACKNOWLEDGEMENT.pdf
Dear Veron,

Please find attached acceptance on the finalisation sign and chop.

Thank You.

Regards,

SHAH

Admin of

2020 SPRAY PAINTING PTE LTD.
H/p: 97166502

Email: 2020spraypainting @ gmail.com

On Tue, Jun 15, 2021 at 2:28 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Shah,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Lump Sum $4700 confirmed @ 7 days

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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