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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: ng yuetlay <ngyuetlay@hotmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 3 June 2021 2:18 PM
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBR 9808J(AIG) AND SDT 1829S AT/ALONG BLK 361 

HOUGANG AVE 5 LINKWAY CARPARK ON 26/05/2021
Attachments: Carpark accident_26 May 21.pptx

Hi Mr Chew, 
 
Please refer to the attached diagram.  It is obvious that having come out of the car park and traveling 
straight to the Block 361 link way, I had a right of way more to it, my car already exited the carpark lot.   
The SDT1829S turn from the right from Block 361 link way as I was traveling straight and hit my car on the 
side proofing that he was aware of my car was in front of him. 
 
Furthermore, SDT1829S after hit my car, he reversed immediately and turn to the left to park his car.  For not 
allowing me to take the picture of the incident, his claimed was that he did not want to block the traffic. 
 
I am familiar with BOLA (barometer of liability chart) that is use by insurance company to determine 
insurance claims. I am prepared to claim against him if SDT1829S insist to claim against me.  
 
 
Ng Yuet Lay 
H-phone 96339609 
 
Sent from Outlook 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, June 2, 2021 1:01 PM 
To: ngyuetlay@hotmail.com <ngyuetlay@hotmail.com> 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBR 9808J(AIG) AND SDT 1829S AT/ALONG BLK 361 HOUGANG AVE 5 LINKWAY 
CARPARK ON 26/05/2021  
  
02 June 2021 
                                                                
Mr Ng Yuet Lay                                                             [By Email Only] 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
You Ref: SBR9808J 
Our Ref: CC6/AIG21006221/pa3 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBR 9808J(AIG) AND SDT 1829S AT/ALONG BLK 361 HOUGANG AVE 5 LINKWAY CARPARK 
ON 26/05/2021 
  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor 
insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. to deal with the third-party claim against your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SDT1829S against your insurance policy. 
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Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information 
given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to 
negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant. 
  
If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third-party claim, kindly let us have them in 
writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 13/06/2021, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant 
on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver 
against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial 
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third-Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will 
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of 
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.  
  
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 


