Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 July 2021 11:51 AM

To: kennychan@alanutd.com

Subject: RE: ATTACHED YK999P CLAIM DOCUMENT FOR PROCESS CLAIM , YOUR INSURED

TAXI SHD2013)
Attachments: DV_YK999P.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We confirm settlement at $1,745.45(all-in) as per your LOD.

Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return together with your workshop invoice bill to India International

Insurance Pte Ltd to us (LKK) for our necessary action.

No.
Vehicle Insured : SHDZ2013J
Accident Date 1 23-May-2021 Date
our Ref : 021080 (III) / CHAN PAGE

CHIF HONG FARM PRODUCT
14 WOODLANDS TERRACE
Singapore 738439

FINAL REPAIR COST FOR MIT.CANTER FEBE21EAZ1131 YK999F

To supply spare parts

To putty and spray replaced parts
To remove, cut-out damaged parts,
panel beating, welding, align,
refix and to renew above parts

Add 7% GST

Total

16132

10-Jun-2021

1

98.00

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred

from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 June 2021 4:43 PM

To: kennychan@alanutd.com

Subject: RE: ATTACHED YK999P CLAIM DOCUMENT FOR PROCESS CLAIM, YOUR INSURED TAXI SHD2013)

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 10/06/2021.

We will look into the matter and get back to you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: Thursday, 10 June 2021 3:54 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: ATTACHED YK999P CLAIM DOCUMENT FOR PROCESS CLAIM , YOUR INSURED TAXI SHD2013)J

Hi Hsiao Tong



Attached our client vehicle YK999P claim document for your perusal , please let us have your DV once the claim
amount is confirm ,thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, June 01, 2021 11:43 AM

To: kennychan@alanutd.com

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SHD2013J ,0URS YK999P ACCIDENT ON 23-05-2021

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear / under
BOLA (subject to BOLA guideline settlement) and shall proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned
case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to
your client’s vehicle and admission of any liability to our Insured’s part. The final repair cost is subjected to the
consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the
number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor and approved by our principal.

*Kindly arrange for survey.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: kennychan@alanutd.com <kennychan@alanutd.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 1 June 2021 9:48 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: CHECKING LIABILITY FOR T. P. CLAIM SHD2013J ,0URS YK999P ACCIDENT ON 23-05-2021

Hi Hsiao Tong

Attached our client GIA report, repair estimate for access liability , claiming your insured taxi SHD2013J ,our client
vehicle is YK999P accident on 23-05-2021 , please reply within two working days otherwise we will call your surveyor
just for pre repair survey and we will get independent to conduct the survey for submitting claim from our

lawyer ,thank you .

Regards

Kenny

Alan’s United Auto Pte Ltd
64538686



