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Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: PBSP <pml-pbsp@simedarby.com.sg>
Sent: July 8, 2021 4:26 PM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin A; Admin-D (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: LOD Y/Ref: SMM6325B O/Ref: DS/2398075/SJT8327G
Attachments: SKM_558e21070816330.pdf; SKM_558e21070816320.pdf

Hi Jasper, 
 
We refer to our LOD of 30.06.21. 
 
We would like to re-quantify our client's claim as follows: 
 
COR: $15,777.52 
LOU: $1,440.00 ($120*12) 
GIA search: $2.00 
Medical: $1,495.80 (Invoice ref PP55027 & HF59760) - Final 
Total: $18,715.32 
 
Attached are the final medical invoices for your perusal, please seek mandate and revert soonest. 
 
Regards, 
Evelyn 
DID: 6319 0175 Fax: 6479 4601 
c/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941  
 

From: PBSP 
Sent: Thursday, 1 July 2021 12:44 PM 

To: 甯珺 © <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: LOD Y/Ref: SMM6325B O/Ref: DS/2398075/SJT8327G  
  
Hi, 
  
We refer to the above. 
  
Attached herewith copy of our LOD dated 30.06.21 and all it supporting documents for your perusal. 
  
Please let us have your offer soon. 
  
Originals are in the mail. 
  
Regards, 
Evelyn 
c/o Performance Motors Limited - Body and Paint 
303 Alexandra Road Singapore 159941 
DID: 6319 0175 Fax: 6479 4601 
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