Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 June 2021 12:18 pm

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); 'Jessie Ong'; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg;
andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg; ppemclaims@gmail.com

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: GBH316Z OD INDIA FINALIZE - DOA: 18/05/2021

Dear Ezel,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirm Lump Sum $1,600.00 before excess $1,500.00 & 5 repair days.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 14 June 2021 10:10 pm

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jessie Ong' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg;
andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg; ppemclaims@gmail.com

Subject: GBH316Z OD INDIA FINALIZE - DOA: 18/05/2021

Hi Shiau Chan,

Kindly seek mandate $1600 (L/S, before GST). 5 repair days.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: ppemclaims@gmail.com <ppemclaims@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 11 June 2021 10:16 AM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Jessie Ong' <jessie.ong@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg
<ezel@panpacificleasing.com.sg>; andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg <andrew.goh@panpacificleasing.com.sg>
Subject: GBH316Z OD INDIA FINALIZE - DOA: 18/05/2021

Hi Steve,
We will undertake the repair of this vehicle @ COR L/S $1,600.00 (before GST & excess) with 5 repair days.
Kindly confirm acceptance.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Ezel Tejano

Accident Claim Officer

+65 8721 3003 | ezel @panpacificleasing.com.sg

EFFICIENT MOTOR & ENGINEERING WORKS PTE LTD (Workshop)
56 Loyang Way, #06-07,Loyang Enterprise Building, Singapore 508775




