Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 20 May 2021 1:31 pm

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: OD /9171350859SG / SKS846X DOA 10 May 2021

Hi Shiau Chan,

MV - 123k

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@Ilkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 May 2021 1:57 PM

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Re: OD / 9171350859SG / SKS846X DOA 10 May 2021

Dear Steve,

Kindly assist to quote the range of MV...thanks.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 19 May 2021 1:53 pm

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Re: OD / 9171350859SG / SKS846X DOA 10 May 2021

Hi

Kindly assist with market value.



Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.:
Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended Deregistration Date:
Vehicle Make:
Vehicle Model:
Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:
Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:
Actual ARF Paid:
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: |
COE Cétegory:
COE Period(Years):
QP Paid: o
COE Rebate Amount:
Total Rebate Amount:
The information contained herein is correct as at 12 May 2021

Priscilla Sim LK
Senior Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

AIG Building 78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1755



priscilla-lk.sim@aig.com | www.aig.sg




