Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 June 2021 4:46 PM

To: 'kenjilee@woodlandstransport.com.sg'

Cc: goo@woodlandstransport.com.sg; Admin A

Subject: [REJECT CLAIM] RE: LOD PA6515Y VS SMK9100Z DOA 9/4/21 *** LKK REF:
CS/AIG21004744/R1ea3n2-1

Attachments: Ol FRONT VIDEO.MP4

Hi Kenji,

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed a copy of the video for your easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client swerved into
our insured lane after the junction, your client should travel into the right most lane instead of traveling into our
insured lane.

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and
unable to look into your client’s claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 | did: 6841-6051
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: kenjilee@woodlandstransport.com.sg <kenjilee@woodlandstransport.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 24 May 2021 9:21 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Cc: goo@woodlandstransport.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LOD PA6515Y VS SMK9100Z DOA 9/4/21 *** LKK REF: CS/AIG21004744/R1ea3n2-1

Hi Mei Kwan,

Thank you for the reply.

Aside to Asher,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMK9100Z WITH OUR VEHICLE PA6515Y ON 09/04/2021

We refer to the above accident and understand that you are the insurer appointed surveyor of SMK9100K



From our investigation, we are of opinion that the accident arose as a result of your insured’s negligent driving.
Our loss in this connection comprises the following:
1. Cost Of Repair 428.00

S
2. 2 Days Loss Of Use S 700.00
3. Search Fees S 2.00

Total S 1,130.00

Please let us know whether you are prepared to admit liability and reimburse our loss in full within the next two weeks
on receipt of this letter otherwise we will proceed the matters legally which we will recourse the costs incurred to
you.

Please acknowledge receipt of this Letter of Demand

Thank you.

Thank you.

Thanks and Regards,

Renji Lo T2

Claims Department

@ Woodlands Transport

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd

8, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564

Main Line :+65 6559 8988 Fax :+65 6898 2394
Direct Line : +65 6559 8954
www.woodlandstransport.com.sg L £,

Group of Companies: ~ WTStrovel 2 casusox
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 21 May 2021 5:28 PM




To: kenjilee@woodlandstransport.com.sg; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@I|kkauto.com>
Cc: goo@woodlandstransport.com.sg; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: LOD PA6515Y VS SMK9100Z DOA 9/4/21 *** LKK REF: CS/AIG21004744/R1ea3n2-1

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi Asher,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: kenjilee@woodlandstransport.com.sg [mailto:kenjilee@woodlandstransport.com.sg]
Sent: Tuesday, 20 April 2021 2:56 PM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto) <JiaLe@lkkauto.com>

Cc: goo@woodlandstransport.com.sg

Subject: LOD PA6515Y VS SMK9100Z DOA 9/4/21

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMK9100Z WITH OUR VEHICLE PA6515Y ON 09/04/2021
We refer to the above accident and understand that you are the insurer appointed surveyor of SMK9100K
From our investigation, we are of opinion that the accident arose as a result of your insured’s negligent driving.
Our loss in this connection comprises the following:

1. Cost Of Repair 428.00

S
2. 2 Days Loss Of Use S 700.00
3. Search Fees S 2.00

Total S 1,130.00

Please let us know whether you are prepared to admit liability and reimburse our loss in full within the next two weeks
on receipt of this letter otherwise we will proceed the matters legally which we will recourse the costs incurred to
you.

Please acknowledge receipt of this Letter of Demand



Thank you.

Thanks and Regards,

Renji Lee E ¥ 3¢

Claims Department

@‘Wuodlands TranspurtE

Woodlands Transport Service Pte Ltd

8, Gul Circle, Singapore 629564

Main Line :+65 6559 8988 Fax :+65 6898 2394
Direct Line : +65 6559 8954
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Group of Companies: ~ WTStravel 2 casusox
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