Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)

From: Stina Chen <stina.chen@grab.com>
Sent: Thursday, 8 July 2021 10:03 AM
To: Jasper Chua (LKK Auto)
Cc: Celyn Lim; Admin A
Subject: Re: [External] Accident involving SLH 40A and SLW 8113S on the 19/05/2021
Hi Jasper
Pls proceed
Thanks
Stina Chen / Associate - Insurance &
E " Claimsstina.chen@grab.com / +65 90663588Grab18 Sin
Ming Lane, #01-08 Midview CitySingapore

573960https://www.grab.com

On Thu, Jul 8, 2021 at 9:53 AM Jasper Chua (LKK Auto) <jasperchua@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
We refer to the above matter.

We understand Grab is willing to do private settlement for settlement at $2,000.00+/-. LOD and final
estimate attached for your easy reference.

We propose to offer TP workshop as below :

1.Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 1,048.60
2.Loss of Use (2 days x $120.00) $ 240.00
Total $ 1,288.60




Kindly have your approval on proposal above. We will proceed to negotiate with TP workshop for a lower
settlement amount upon approval.

Best Regards,
Jasper Chua| Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jasperchua@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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