Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd@gmail.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 28 December 2021 3:54 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FW: FW: aigencrypt OD CLAIM ACCIDENT DATE 19 MAY 2021 GBH8888L
Attachments: IMG_0004.jpg

Good day Veron
As per attached for your reference and action
Thanks & Regards

Winni

Yee Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722
ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com
Contact No: 6457 2625 Fax: 6252 8459

On Tue, 28 Dec 2021 at 10:58, yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd @ gmail.com> wrote:
Good day Veron

As per attached for your reference and action
Thanks & Regards

winni

Yee Auto Pte Ltd

160 Sin Ming Drive

#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity
Singapore 575722

ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com
Contact No: 6457 2625 Fax: 6252 8459

On Mon, 27 Dec 2021 at 15:17, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Winni,

Kindly forward repair bill and discharge voucher for us to close file.



Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur @lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 1 S(408933)

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd @ gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, 23 December 2021 9:26 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: FW: aigencrypt OD CLAIM ACCIDENT DATE 19 MAY 2021 GBH8888L

Good day Veron

Attached towing bill

Thanks & Regards

Winni

Yee Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com

Contact No: 6457 2625 Fax: 6252 8459



On Mon, 13 Dec 2021 at 18:01, yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd @ gmail.com> wrote:

Good day Veron

We accept the amount $6000 before GST

Thanks & Regards

Winni

Yee Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722

ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com

Contact No: 6457 2625 Fax: 6252 8459

On Mon, 6 Dec 2021 at 10:50, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Winni,

Please updates.

Kindly provide towing invoice.

Re-finalize Lump Sum $6000/- (subject to insurance approval)
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Please check and confirmed

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 23 November 2021 1:12 PM

To: yeeautopteltd @ gmail.com

Subject: FW: aigencrypt OD CLAIM ACCIDENT DATE 19 MAY 2021 GBH8888L

Dear Winni,

Kindly provide towing invoice.

Re-finalize Lump Sum $6000/- (subject to insurance approval)

Please check and confirmed



Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur @lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 7 October 2021 5:55 PM

To: 'yeeauto pteltd' <yeeautopteltd @ gmail.com>

Subject: RE: aigencrypt OD CLAIM ACCIDENT DATE 19 MAY 2021 GBH8888L

Dear Winni,

As spoken, attach revised estimate.

Please check and re-finalize.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur @lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 28 June 2021 12:59 PM

To: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd @ gmail.com>; SUR <sur@]lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: aigencrypt OD CLAIM ACCIDENT DATE 19 MAY 2021 GBH8888L

Dear Winni,

Supplementary not approved.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 1 S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 24 May 2021 5:32 PM

To: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd @gmail.com>; SUR <sur@]Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: aigencrypt OD CLAIM ACCIDENT DATE 19 MAY 2021 GBH8888L

Dear Winni,



As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle GBH 8888L, (Excess $600/-).

If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at Tel:
6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspection.

All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance company
before completion of the repair.

*Qur client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

*COR to be on Part by Part basis, cost plus 15%

Supplier invoice is to provide for parts replaced upon finalize

Before paint photos, New Parts photos required.

All Old Parts is to lay out during before paint reinspection

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur @lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 1 S(408933)

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd @ gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 21 May 2021 4:56 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com>

Cec: SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: aigencrypt OD CLAIM ACCIDENT DATE 19 MAY 2021 GBH8888L

Good day Sirs

As per attached for your reference and action

Thanks & Regards

Winni

Yee Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722
ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com

Contact No: 6457 2625 Fax: 6252 8459

On Fri, 21 May 2021 at 13:44, Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

Kindly get insured driver’s to sign interview form and undertaking.



Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: yeeauto pteltd <yeeautopteltd @ gmail.com>

Sent: Thursday, May 20, 2021 5:25 PM

To: AIG SGP, Claims-Survey <AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] OD CLAIM ACCIDENT DATE 19 MAY 2021 GBH8888L

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Good day Sirs

Kindly submit for OD Claim

Thanks & Regards

Winni

Yee Auto Pte Ltd
160 Sin Ming Drive
#02-17 Sin Ming AutoCity

Singapore 575722



ROC & GST No.: 201719251W

email: yeeautopteltd@gmail.com

Contact No: 6457 2625 Fax: 6252 8459
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