Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 August 2021 2:21 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Finalisation for vehicle GBF5888S || Accident Involving GBF5888S & SJB4960Z On
15/05/2021

Dear Veron,

We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.
Kindly be informed that we confirm acceptance of:-

Lump Sum $5300

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 11 August 2021 1:56 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Finalisation for vehicle GBF5888S || Accident Involving GBF5888S & SJB4960Z On 15/05/2021

Dear Ms Heng,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Re-offer Lump Sum $5300 @ 6 days

Please check and confirmed.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 4 August 2021 9:10 AM

To: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Finalisation for vehicle GBF5888S | | Accident Involving GBF5888S & SJB4960Z On 15/05/2021

Hi Ms Heng,

| will offer at $ 5000, if not agree with the finalised, | will submit.
I’m just following instruction

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Woon Meng [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sq]

Sent: Tuesday, 3 August, 2021 12:23 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Finalisation for vehicle GBF5888S || Accident Involving GBF5888S & SJB4960Z On 15/05/2021
Importance: High

Dear Rasul,

We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.

Kindly be informed that we are still awaiting your reply for this case till date. Please assist for this case urgently.
We seek your kind understanding in this matter and look forward to your soonest reply.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

From: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 30 July 2021 10:02 AM

To: 'Rasul@lkkauto.com' <Rasul@I|kkauto.com>

Subject: Finalisation for vehicle GBF5888S | | Accident Involving GBF5888S & SJB4960Z On 15/05/2021




Dear Rasul,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.

As per information emailed to you on 29/07/2021, please assist to check the parts prices. Please also note that there is
typo error in the rear sensor amount, the amount should be $220.00. Please also adjust the labour for ‘R & R light
wiring’.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@|kkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 July 2021 10:01 AM

To: Woon Meng <woonmeng@singnet.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Finalisation for vehicle GBF5888S | | Accident Involving GBF5888S & SJB4960Z On 15/05/2021

Ms Heng,

refer to attachment
Finalised amount is $ 4,950

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 21 July, 2021 2:40 PM

To: Woon Meng

Subject: RE: Finalisation for vehicle GBF5888S || Accident Involving GBF5888S & SIB4960Z On 15/05/2021

Hi Ms Heng,
Refer to attachment for finalised amount,
Audit checked some part prices slightly high, required to be audited

Finalised amount is $ 4,500 / 6 days of lump sum repair
Kindly confirm



Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Woon Meng [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sq]

Sent: Wednesday, 21 July, 2021 1:41 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin-D (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: Finalisation for vehicle GBF5888S || Accident Involving GBF5888S & SIB4960Z On 15/05/2021
Importance: High

Dear Rasul,

We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.

Kindly assist to finalise for this case please.

We seek your kind understanding in reverting for this case soonest.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

From: Woon Meng [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 16 July 2021 11:04 AM

To: 'rasul@lkkauto.com' <rasul@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Summer (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Finalisation for vehicle GBF5888S | | Accident Involving GBF5888S & SJB4960Z On 15/05/2021
Importance: High

Dear Rasul,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.
Kindly assist to finalise for this case please.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050



From: Woon Meng [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 9 July 2021 9:26 AM

To: 'rasul@lkkauto.com' <rasul@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Summer (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Finalisation for vehicle GBF5888S | | Accident Involving GBF5888S & SJB4960Z On 15/05/2021
Importance: High

Dear Rasul,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.

Kindly assist to finalise for this case please.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

From: Woon Meng [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 3 July 2021 12:35 PM

To: 'rasul@lkkauto.com' <rasul@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Summer (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; 'Admin A' <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Finalisation for vehicle GBF5888S | | Accident Involving GBF5888S & SJB4960Z On 15/05/2021
Importance: High

Dear Rasul,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.

Kindly assist to finalise for this case please.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

From: Woon Meng [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 25 June 2021 12:51 PM

To: 'rasul@lkkauto.com' <rasul@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Admin A' <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; 'Summer (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Finalisation for vehicle GBF5888S | | Accident Involving GBF5888S & SJB4960Z On 15/05/2021

Dear Rasul,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.

Kindly assist to finalise for this case please.



Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050

From: Woon Meng [mailto:woonmeng@singnet.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 14 June 2021 1:40 PM

To: 'rasul@lkkauto.com' <rasul@|kkauto.com>

Subject: Finalisation for vehicle GBF5888S | | Accident Involving GBF5888S & SJB4960Z On 15/05/2021

Dear Rasul,
We refer to the matter below for your kind attention.
Kindly assist to finalise for this case please.

Thank you & Warmest Regards,

Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

50, Bukit Batok Street 23

#01-06 Midview Building, Singapore (659578)
Tel : 63161131 /63161151 || Fax:63167050



