
7/22/2021 Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMkAGU0ZDViNzgxLWE5MTItNDkxMi1hZWIxLTA3MjhlMTA0N2RiNgBGAAAAAADl7f6wE2MfQpF%2BZ… 1/1
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Loi Ai Ting <aiting.loi@cyclecarriage.com.sg>
Thu 22/7/2021 10:02 AM
To:  Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Jojo Cheng <jojo.cheng@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Lauro Araos Songcuan JR <lauro.songcuan@cyclecarriage.com.sg>;
Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

1 attachments (177 KB)
[Untitled].pdf;

Dear Sir/Madam,
 
Attached our repair invoice, and Authorisation to Act, for your perusal.
 
Our client’s claim is as stated below:
 
COR       $ 16,476.50
LOU       $   3,200.00 ($100/day x 32 days)
                ---------------
Total      $ 19,676.50
                ----------------
 
Kindly offer for settlement.
 
Appreciate.
 
 
 
Best Regards,
 
Loi Ai Ting
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DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of
the individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not
the intended recipient, you are notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this email in error, please notify
us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are those of
the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any
of its related corporations.
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