Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: MS Car Auto <mscarautopl@gmail.com>

Sent: Friday, 1 October 2021 4:35 pm

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: TG Lim (LKK Auto); SUR

Subject: Re: KINDLY ADVISE THE STATUS OF FBK 7096X DOA: 07/05/2021

Hi Shiau Chen,

WE confirm the acceptance of the finalise amt of $3300.00 and 4 repair days.
Kindly advise who is the handler for this case so that | can send the LOD.

Thank You and Stay Safe @

Warmest Regards,
Yap June
MS Car Auto Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07

Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875

Telephone: 6385-1838
Fax : 6386-1838

On Thu, Sep 30, 2021 at 2:05 PM Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

Dear June,

As spoken with you.

Offer Lump Sum $3,300.00 and 4 repair days. (subject to insurance approval)

Kindly check and confirm.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 August 2021 10:36 am

To: mscarautopl@gmail.com

Subject: KINDLY ADVISE THE STATUS OF FBK 7096X DOA: 07/05/2021

Dear June,

Kindly advise the status of FBK 7096X.

If done of repair works, kindly send us the final bill for finalise.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



