Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 May 2021 4:11 PM

To: Edwin Abcede Caina; Nadaraja, Deeban; AlG SGP, Claims-Survey; SUR; Admin-D
(LKKAuto)

Cc: Azlan, Syazairdina; Andre Chow En De; Coco Lu Ting; Kevin Leong Wai Kit; Mohd Rizal,
Nur Mariah Huibrechts; Parthiban, Theerthan

Subject: aigencrypt RE: - AIG — RE: SLS729M & SKB838J Pending authorization to repair

Hi Edwin,

Noted on the video. Kindly be informed total excess has been amended to $300

Claim adjudicated based on current material facts, we reserve our rights to handle the case if deemed appropriate as
and when new material facts arise or there is any incoming third party claim against insured’s policy.

Best regards,

Mariesa Abu Kassim (Mariesa)

AlG

Claims Adjuster Il

Auto Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

Tel: 8001206556 | Ext: 1012202
NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com | www.aig.com

From: Edwin Abcede Caina <edwin.caina@cyclecarriage.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, May 20, 2021 12:11 PM

To: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>; Nadaraja, Deeban <Deeban.Nadaraja@aig.com>;
AIG SGP, Claims-Survey <AIGSGP_ClaimsSurvey@aig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; admin <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu
Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Mohd Rizal, Nur
Mariah Huibrechts <NurMariahHuibrechts.MohdRizal@aig.com>; Parthiban, Theerthan
<Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: - AIG — RE: SLS729M & SKB838J Pending authorization to repair

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.
Hi Mariesa,

Client has provided us the video footage. Thank you

Best Regards,

Edwin Caina
Advisor- Customer Service
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From: Abu Kassim, Noor Mariesa <NoorMariesa.AbuKassim@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, May 20, 2021 10:16 AM

To: Nadaraja, Deeban <Deeban.Nadaraja@aig.com>; Edwin Abcede Caina <edwin.caina@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; AlG
SGP, Claims-Survey <AIGSGP ClaimsSurvey@aig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; admin <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>; Andre Chow En De <andre.chow@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Coco Lu
Ting <coco.lu@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Kevin Leong Wai Kit <kevin.leong@cyclecarriage.com.sg>; Mohd Rizal, Nur
Mariah Huibrechts <NurMariahHuibrechts.MohdRizal@aig.com>; Parthiban, Theerthan
<Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>

Subject: - AIG — RE: SLS729M & SKB838J Pending authorization to repair

This email was sent from outside of your organisation

AlG Pad

This is a secure, encrypted message. To read it, open the
attachment.

Este es un mensaje cifrado y seguro. Para leerlo, abra el archivo
adjunto.

Esta é uma mensagem criptografada segura. Para |é-lo, abra o
anexo.

Ceci est une sécurité, un message crypté. Pour le lire, ouvrez la
piece jointe.

NIEESEEIN-BEFA—ILTY, BEICEFTI7MIL
ZRWVWTLESLY,

Click here by 2021-05-27 10:15 +08 to read your message.
After that, open the attachment.

More Info



DISCLAIMER:- This email and any attachment to it is confidential and intended only for the use of the individual or entity
named above and may contain information that is privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are notified that
any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email or any attachment is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
email in error, please notify us immediately by return email and destroy the original message. Any views expressed are
those of the individual sender, and not necessarily the views of Cycle Carriage Industries Pte Ltd and/or any of its
related corporations.



