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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Lim, Kok-Chong <Kok-Chong.Lim@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 May 2021 9:15 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR; Sim, Priscilla-LK

Subject: RE: SLA 1899U-DOA: 15/5/2021 (AIG REF: 9516187402SG)

Moring Veron, 

 

Thank you for the notification.  

 

Please do the needy and have all documents ready in Merimen and keep Priscilla promptly posted once done. 

Meantime, please inform repairer to have Insured’s vehicle dismantle parts assembled if done so. All removed parts are 

to be in tact back into vehicle. 

 

Best Regards, 

 

Kok Chong  

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, May 25, 2021 9:06 AM 

To: Lim, Kok-Chong <Kok-Chong.Lim@aig.com>; Sim, Priscilla-LK <Priscilla-LK.Sim@aig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: [EXTERNAL] SLA 1899U-DOA: 15/5/2021 (AIG REF: 9516187402SG) 

 

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments. 

Dear Kok Chong, 
 
 
According to repairer, they are unable to undertake with Repair Limit not exceeding $86,900.00, therefore vehicle 
recommended to be Total Loss. 
 
 
 
Dear Ms Sim, 
 
Please be informed that vehicle recommended Total Loss. Kindly informed insured. 
 
We are in the midst of preparing report, once done will informed you. 
 
  

 

 

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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