6/10/2021 Mail - Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) - Outlook
RE: ACC ON 13.05.2021 INVLG SGN 7890 U & GBJ 913 P - SETTLEMENT *** LKK REF:
CC4/FCI21005914/Ura3

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Thu 6/10/2021 12:14 PM

To: Lim Gan Koon (Chris) <ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

U 5 attachments (2 MB)
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[Untitled]02062021154715_3-6.jpg; [Untitled]14052021111912_6-7.jpg;

Dear Chris,

Enclosed TP LOD.

We will submit our survey report ASAP.

Hi Jaslin,

Please expedite.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Peiwen [mailto:peiwen@procarcare.com.sg] On Behalf Of Claims

Sent: Thursday, 10 June 2021 10:17 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg>

Subject: ACC ON 13.05.2021 INVLG SGN 7890 U & GBJ 913 P - SETTLEMENT

Hi Sirs,

Please refer to the attached with our LOD for your early settlement.
Thank You.

Regards,

Pei Wen NG

Claims Advisory

Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd

Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 01-45/46 Singapore 408716
T: +65 6741 5336 | F:+65 6741 7208

E: claims@procarcare.com.sg

https://outlook.office.com/mail/id/AAQkAGY 5MjASNjAXLWUzOTktNDAzMi1hNmYyLWQzMjg1MjhjYjA20QAQACI2ybLzo0wqgr50%2F0udrds %3D 12
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*With effect from 1 Sep 2018, Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd has been rebranded as Progressive Car Care
Pte Ltd. You may now reach us at our new email addresses (@procarcare.com.sg). We look forward to your
continued support.
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RE: ACC ON 13.05.2021 INVLG SGN 7890 U & GBJ 913 P - SETTLEMENT *** LKK REF:
CC4/FCI21005914/Ura3

Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>
Thu 6/10/2021 12:15 PM

To: Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg>
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@Ilkkauto.com>; Lim Gan Koon (Chris)
<ChrisLim@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.
Please liaise with our principal for this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: Peiwen [mailto:peiwen@procarcare.com.sg] On Behalf Of Claims

Sent: Thursday, 10 June 2021 10:17 AM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: Claims <claims@procarcare.com.sg>

Subject: ACC ON 13.05.2021 INVLG SGN 7890 U & GBJ 913 P - SETTLEMENT

Hi Sirs,

Please refer to the attached with our LOD for your early settlement.
Thank You.

Regards,

Pei Wen NG

Claims Advisory

Progressive Car Care Pte Ltd

Blk 3022A Ubi Road 1 01-45/46 Singapore 408716
T: +65 6741 5336 | F:+65 6741 7208

E: claims@procarcare.com.sg
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*With effect from 1 Sep 2018, Progressive Automotive Pte Ltd has been rebranded as Progressive Car Care
Pte Ltd. You may now reach us at our new email addresses (@procarcare.com.sg). We look forward to your
continued support.
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