
1

Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur <Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 20 May 2021 5:25 PM

To: operation@tlauto.com.sg

Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang; Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts; Parthiban, Theerthan; Nadaraja, 

Deeban; SUR

Subject: aigencrypt - RE: - SLL1400S / 6015570429SG

Dear Candy, 

 

Coverage has been confirmed and final excess is S$2,000.00 

 

‘Claim adjudicated based on current material facts, we reserve our rights to handle the case if deemed appropriate as 

and when new material facts arise or there is any incoming third party claim against insured’s policy’. 

 

 
Thanks and regards, 
  
Aashweenjeet Kaur (Aashween) 
AIG 
Claims Adjuster II 
Auto Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 
Tel 8001206556 | Ext: 1002215 
Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com  | www.aig.sg 

 

From: operation@tlauto.com.sg <operation@tlauto.com.sg>  

Sent: Thursday, May 20, 2021 12:34 PM 

To: Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur <Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com> 

Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts 

<NurMariahHuibrechts.MohdRizal@aig.com>; Parthiban, Theerthan <Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>; Nadaraja, 

Deeban <Deeban.Nadaraja@aig.com>; sur@lkkauto.com; operation@tlauto.com.sg 

Subject: RE: - SLL1400S / 6015570429SG 

 

Dear All, 

 

Please find attached police report for your kind attention  

 

Best Regards, 

Candy Ong  

Tong Luck Auto Pte Ltd 
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From: Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur 

Sent: Thu, 20 May 2021 04:23:49 +0000 

To: operation@tlauto.com.sg 

Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang, Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts, Parthiban, Theerthan, Nadaraja, Deeban, 

sur@lkkauto.com 

Subject: - SLL1400S / 6015570429SG 

Dear Sir/ Ma’am, 

 

May we get an update on the police report. 

 

Thanks and regards, 

  

Aashweenjeet Kaur (Aashween) 

AIG 

Claims Adjuster II 

Auto Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 

Tel 8001206556 | Ext: 1002215 

Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com  | www.aig.sg 

 

From: Mithoosingh, Aashweenjeetkaur  

Sent: Monday, May 17, 2021 2:44 PM 

To: operation@tlauto.com.sg 

Cc: Lim, Sheng Yang <ShengYang.Lim@aig.com>; Mohd Rizal, Nur Mariah Huibrechts 

<NurMariahHuibrechts.MohdRizal@aig.com>; Parthiban, Theerthan <Theerthan.Parthiban@aig.com>; 

Nadaraja, Deeban <Deeban.Nadaraja@aig.com>; sur@lkkauto.com 

Subject: aigencrypt - SLL1400S / 6015570429SG 
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Dear Sir/ Ma’am, 

 

Kindly assist to request Insured to submit police report as 3rd party driver (SHD2674B) reported injured and 

received medical leave for more than 3 days. 

 

 

Thanks and regards, 

  

Aashweenjeet Kaur (Aashween) 

AIG 

Claims Adjuster II 

Auto Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. 

Tel 8001206556 | Ext: 1002215 
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Aashweenjeetkaur.Mithoosingh@aig.com  | www.aig.sg 

 


