Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 May 2021 4:56 PM

To: Edwin Abcede Caina

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto); Denise Tay (LKKAuto); Azlan, Syazairdina; SUR
Subject: RE: aigencrypt OD claim SME5919L - Repairer estimates

Dear Edwin,

Kindly assist to activate the replacement car today.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Azlan, Syazairdina <Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 May 2021 11:52 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@Ikkauto.com>; Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: aigencrypt OD claim SME5919L - Repairer estimates

Dear Veron,
Insured would like to activate the replacement car today. Kindly assist to relay the message to the workshop.

Thank you.

Thanks and regards,

Syaza Irdina Azlan

AIG

Express Claims Adjuster I, Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations — Auto
SG Claims Operations | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Tel:8001206556 | Ext:1012205

Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com | www.aig.sg

From: Azlan, Syazairdina

Sent: Tuesday, May 11, 2021 8:55 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: aigencrypt OD claim SME5919L - Repairer estimates
Importance: High

Dear Veron,

Kindly assist to upload repairer estimates in Merimen.



Thank you.

Thanks and regards,

Syaza Irdina Azlan

AIG

Express Claims Adjuster Il, Singapore FNOL, Claims Operations — Auto
SG Claims Operations | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
Tel:8001206556 | Ext:1012205

Syazairdina.Azlan@aig.com | www.aig.sg




