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SMT460X // DOA: 07/05/2021 // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21005669/Npa3

Goh, Beatrice-CH <Beatrice-CH.Goh@aia.com>
Wed 24/11/2021 10:11 AM
To:  Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Cc:  Sim, Hazel-YT <Hazel-YT.Sim@aia.com>

Dear Hsiao Tong,
 
We have no objection since you are the appointed AIG loss adjustor.
 

 

 
Beatrice Goh
Senior Manager – Corporate Real Estate
1 Robinson Road, AIA Tower
#11-00 Singapore 048542
T : 6531 8971
E : beatrice-ch.goh@aia.com
 
aia.com.sg
AIA Singapore Private Limited – an AIA Group Company

 

Follow us on      

Go Green! Please consider before printing this email.
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 19 November 2021 3:52 pm

To: Goh, Beatrice-CH <Beatrice-CH.Goh@aia.com>

Subject: RE: SMT460X // DOA: 07/05/2021 // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21005669/Npa3
 
Please be aware. This email originated from outside AIA. Do not click on links or open attachments unless
you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 

We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that we do not have a good defense towards
the claim submitted by SHC1909L as your vehicle changed lane and collided with third party. We
shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement of the third-party claim at best to avoid
further litigation, which would escalate to even more cost.

 

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 07 days from the date of this letter.

http://www.facebook.com/aiasingapore
http://www.instagram.com/AIASingapore
https://www.linkedin.com/company/aia-singapore
http://www.youtube.com/SingaporeAIA


11/24/21, 2:13 PM Mail - Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAMkAGU0ZDViNzgxLWE5MTItNDkxMi1hZWIxLTA3MjhlMTA0N2RiNgBGAAAAAADl7f6wE2MfQpF%2BZ… 2/4

 

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected upon next renewal due to
this Third-Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

 

Thank you.

 
 

 
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

 
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, 11 June 2021 5:29 PM

To: Goh, Beatrice-CH <Beatrice-CH.Goh@aia.com>

Subject: Re: SMT460X // DOA: 07/05/2021 // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21005669/Npa3
 
 
Dear Ms Beatrice,
 
Attached is a copy of the damage photos of third-party taxi as requested.

 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused
is much regretted. 

 

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 May 2021 3:10 PM

To: Goh, Beatrice-CH <Beatrice-CH.Goh@aia.com>

Subject: Re: SMT460X // DOA: 07/05/2021 // LKK Ref: CC4/AIG21005669/Npa3
 

mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:Beatrice-CH.Goh@aia.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com
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Dear Beatrice,
 
We noted on your below email.
 
We await your response. Thanks.

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused
is much regretted. 

 

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: Goh, Beatrice-CH <Beatrice-CH.Goh@aia.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 18 May 2021 2:33 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SMT460X
 
Dear AIG,
 
We refer to your letter of 11 May 2021 reference : 9653459631SG-004.
 
From the above letter we were alerted of an accident involving our company car SMT460X on 7 May 2021
with another vehicle SHC1909L. As we were all working-from-home we only came to see your letter of 11 May
2021 today and hence would like to seek an extension of time to respond after speaking to our team of
drivers.
 
Please give us until 21 May 2021 to respond. You may contact me at 96633208 for clarification.
 

 

 
Beatrice Goh
Section Head – Real Estate, Leasing & Administration
1 Robinson Road, AIA Tower
#11-00 Singapore 048542
T : 6531 8971
E : beatrice-ch.goh@aia.com
 
aia.com.sg
AIA Singapore Private Limited – an AIA Group Company

 

Follow us on      
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Go Green! Please consider before printing this email.
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE: The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the
intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or
printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect
that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the
recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIA Group Limited or its
subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
IMPORTANT NOTICE: The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are
not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received
this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the
original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed
to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by AIA Group Limited or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or
severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
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Claim Audit

 

 
AUDIT TRAIL
No. On Audit Remarks By

1
10 May
2021
17:34

Clm Dtl
Modified Claimant's Name: -> COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD. Claimant's ID: -> 199303821R. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

2
10 May
2021
17:34

Clm Veh
Model
Changed

(205282) HYUNDAI AE IONIQ HEV DCT 1.6 (A). [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

3
10 May
2021
17:34

Clm Created
Reg No: SHC1909L. Acct Date: 2021/05/07. Claim Type: TP. Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lt
d. (SG). TP Insurer: AXA Insurance Pte Ltd (HQ). Workshop: ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (Loyan
g)

[A] HOW MEI
KWAN

4
10 May
2021
17:34

Adj Co
Assigned LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ): [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

5
10 May
2021
17:34

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/05/20 [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

6
10 May
2021
17:34

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:0.00.Reinsp:Adj decides. [A] HOW MEI

KWAN

7
10 May
2021
17:34

Clm Ins Co
Changed

[200005] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (SG) -> [203630] AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Ex
press)

[I] Merimen
Administrator

8
10 May
2021
17:34

Label Added (23):Express. [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

9
10 May
2021
17:34

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

[None] -> MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID [A] HOW MEI
KWAN

10
11 May
2021
09:46

Adj
Adjuster
Assigned

MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID -> Muhammad Nazril Bin Abdullah [A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

11
20 May
2021
09:00

Clm
Registration
Modified

Acct Time:18:00:00->18:30:00.

[I] AIG
OneClaim

Integration
User

12
29 May
2021
10:25

Video
Downloaded Downloaded SHC1909L vs SMT460X_TP VIDEO [I] Tan,

Wilson-KL

13
11 Jun
2021
12:21

Video
Downloaded Downloaded SHC1909L vs SMT460X_TP VIDEO [I] Tan,

Wilson-KL

14
11 Jun
2021
12:23

Video
Downloaded Downloaded SHC1909L vs SMT460X_TP VIDEO [I] Tan,

Wilson-KL

15
29 Jun
2021
15:44

Video
Downloaded Downloaded SHC1909L vs SMT460X_TP VIDEO [I] MdNoor,

Norsiah

16
12 Jul
2021
12:12

Video
Downloaded Downloaded SHC1909L vs SMT460X_TP VIDEO(longer Version)

[A]
Muhammad
Nazril Bin
Abdullah

17
19 Nov
2021
15:35

Video
Downloaded Downloaded SHC1909L vs SMT460X_TP VIDEO(longer Version) [I] MdNoor,

Norsiah

18
19 Nov
2021
15:38

Video
Downloaded Downloaded SHC1909L vs SMT460X_TP VIDEO [I] MdNoor,

Norsiah

19
07 Dec
2021
15:42

Adj Rpt
Initiated

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

20
07 Dec
2021
15:42

Clm Dtl
Modified Insured ID: -> -. Claim Conclusion: -> 3.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

21
07 Dec
2021
15:42

Clm Dtl
Modified JPJ Reg. Date: -> 2018/10/08.

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

22
07 Dec
2021
15:42

Clm Details
Notified

[A] JOANNE
LEE KHANG

MIN

23
16 Dec
2021
13:34

Adj
Mandate
Request

Cur.Req:2725.74:Liability: 100%(B15)
*Quantum: (a)CORw/GST: $2,022.98+ (b)LOR(4days x $125.1
9): $500.76 +(c)LOI(4daysx$50):$200.00+ (d)Search fee: $2.00 = Total: $2,725.74
*3 recommendati
on repair days +1PRS = 4days
*For your approval please.

[A] CHEW
HSIAO TONG

24
06 Jan
2022
08:24

Adj Next
Rpt
Changed

Next Rpt:Final Rpt.Due Date:2021/05/20 [I] MdNoor,
Norsiah

25
06 Jan
2022
08:24

Adj
Mandate Set Approved:2725.74. [I] MdNoor,

Norsiah

Date From Date To Audit Type

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setlogin=0&CFID=91169596&CFTOKEN=4f0a32a193a03216-5B368753-EE90-80B1-B639840F77FF53F1&USID=3251&RID=3466436
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=0&CFID=91169596&CFTOKEN=4f0a32a193a03216-5B368753-EE90-80B1-B639840F77FF53F1&USID=3251&RID=3466436
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRroot&fuseaction=dsp_home&setpersonal=1&personal=1&CFID=91169596&CFTOKEN=4f0a32a193a03216-5B368753-EE90-80B1-B639840F77FF53F1&USID=3251&RID=3466436
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCmail&fuseaction=dsp_composemail&mode=0&CFID=91169596&CFTOKEN=4f0a32a193a03216-5B368753-EE90-80B1-B639840F77FF53F1&USID=3251&RID=3466436&urlback=/claims/index.cfm%3Ffusebox%3DMTRadjuster%26fuseaction%3Ddsp_viewhistory%26caseid%3D1007194%26extid%3D361937%26
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/undefined
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsec&fuseaction=act_logout&CFID=91169596&CFTOKEN=4f0a32a193a03216-5B368753-EE90-80B1-B639840F77FF53F1&USID=3251&RID=3466436
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            None Go



ACTIVITY
[11/05/2021 15:19] HOW MEI KWAN:
OINR. To send out first letter.



Merimen Billing for this case - Transaction History

Bill Ref No Bill Date Bill Type Acc Type Acc Name Co Name
(Branch) Ref 1 Ref 2 Amount

2693507 10 May 2021
17:42:01

TP Case
(Insurer) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (Express)

SHC1909L SMT460X 11.00

2697287 27 May 2021
10:30:32 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SHC1909L CHEW HSIAO
TONG xx.xx

2708198 12 Jul 2021
10:42:32 Video Upload Motor

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd.

AIG Asia
Pacific

Insurance Pte.
Ltd. (SG)

SHC1909L CHEW HSIAO
TONG xx.xx

2747273 07 Dec 2021
15:42:25

OD/TP Case
(Adjuster) Motor

LKK Auto
Consultants

Pte Ltd

LKK Auto
Consultants
Pte Ltd (HQ)

SHC1909L SMT460X 11.00







