Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: anna sim <annasimsl@yahoo.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, 29 March 2022 12:26 pm
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: Survey Vehicle FBR8622)

Dear Cecilia,

Apologies for late reply due to | was on MC since 21/3.

Fyi, | have check with the lawyer in-charge of our client injuries,

he says that he has spoken to the 10, the 10 says that they will charge their client to court
and will soon give the PIR to the lawyer.

Btw we have pass the Tax Invoice to the lawyer to help our client claim for his PD.

Regards,

Anna Sim

Atan Motoring Supply Pte Ltd

Tel: 67431351 Fax: 67434158
email add : annasimsl@yahoo.com.sg

On Saturday, 19 March 2022, 01:16:36 pm SGT, Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <ceciliachong@lkkauto.com> wrote:

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

2"Y REMINDER

Dear Anna,

We refer to the above matter.

Kindly let us have a copy of PIR to review the matter within the next 3 days.

Thanks



