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Re: Yr Ref: CC4/AIG17020351/R1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKF 9321C(AIG) & SKD
1838S ON 19/10/2017] & SKD 1838S ON 19/10/2017]

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Fri 28/5/2021 2:47 PM
To:  winnie.fan@3aautomobile.com <winnie.fan@3aautomobile.com>
Cc:  accounts@3aautomobile.com <accounts@3aautomobile.com>

1 attachments (194 KB)
DV_SKD 1838S.pdf;

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with your client's authorisa�on to act to us
(LKK) for our necessary ac�on.  

“Kindly note that this nego�a�on between par�es on this ma�er is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole inten�on of

resolving the ma�er amicably without par�es resor�ng to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this nego�a�on of terms/se�lement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, therea�er, by the nego�a�on terms/se�lement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in so�copy. Any inconvenience caused is much regre�ed. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: winnie.fan@3aautomobile.com <winnie.fan@3aautomobile.com> 
Sent: Thursday, 27 May 2021 3:51 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: accounts@3aautomobile.com <accounts@3aautomobile.com> 
Subject: Re: Yr Ref: CC4/AIG17020351/R1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKF 9321C(AIG) & SKD 1838S ON
19/10/2017] & SKD 1838S ON 19/10/2017]
 
Dear Hsiao Tong,
 
We hereby accepted the below offer $4,334.00. Please let us have the DV.
 
Thanks.
 
Best Regards J
 
Winnie Fan
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 25 May 2021 2:32 pm 
To: winnie.fan@3aautomobile.com 
Cc: accounts@3aautomobile.com 
Subject: **SPAM** Re: Yr Ref: CC4/AIG17020351/R1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKF 9321C(AIG) & SKD 1838S
ON 19/10/2017] & SKD 1838S ON 19/10/2017]
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to the above ma�er.
  
We propose se�lement as follows: -
  

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $  3,852.00
2. Loss of Use (8days x $60.00) $      480.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee $          2.00

Total $ 4,334.00
 
Please confirm acceptance.
 
 
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.”
 
Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via
email. Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused
is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: winnie.fan@3aautomobile.com <winnie.fan@3aautomobile.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 19 May 2021 12:58 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: accounts@3aautomobile.com <accounts@3aautomobile.com> 
Subject: RE: Yr Ref: CC4/AIG17020351/R1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKF 9321C(AIG) & SKD 1838S ON
19/10/2017]
 
Dear Hsiao Tong,
 
We do not accept the below offer, the claim amount remain $4,494.00 as per the attached Letter of
Demand.
 
Thank you.
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Best Regards J
 
Winnie Fan
 
From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Friday, 14 May 2021 2:37 pm 
To: winnie.fan@3aautomobile.com 
Subject: Re: Yr Ref: CC4/AIG17020351/R1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKF 9321C(AIG) & SKD 1838S ON
19/10/2017]
 
Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to the above ma�er.
 
We propose se�lement at a global sum of $4,300.00(all-in).
 
Please confirm acceptance.
 
“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
 
In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially
affect/influence on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement..”
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
 

From: winnie.fan@3aautomobile.com <winnie.fan@3aautomobile.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, 4 May 2021 1:02 PM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: Yr Ref: CC4/AIG17020351/R1pb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKF 9321C(AIG) & SKD 1838S ON
19/10/2017]
 
Dear Hsiao Tong,
 
With regard to the above accident, we enclosed herewith the Letter of Demand for your necessary action.
 
Thank you and have a wonderful day! J
 

Winnie Fan

3A Automobile Pte Ltd
120 Lower Delta Road #02-15 Cendex Centre (S) 169208 
Email: winnie.fan@3aautomobile.com
Website: www.3aautomobile..com
Tel: 6223 1122 | Fax: 6738 6666
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