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Re: YP 1262Z OD LONPAC DOA 30/04/2021

Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Tue 11/5/2021 7:14 AM
To:  simon@kkimhin.com.sg <simon@kkimhin.com.sg>
Cc:  Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Dear Sir/Madam,
 
As instructed by our client , please proceed to repair the insured vehicle YP 1262Z (Excess $600).
 
If there are any check items or supplementary items please inform our office’s Assignment Team at
Tel: 6741 8434 to arrange our surveyor for inspec�on.
 
All supplementary items and unconfirm items are subjected to further approval from insurance
company before comple�on of the repair.
 
*Our client reserve their rights not to pay if there is no valid approval obtained before repair.

Thanks and regards,
Denise
Case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: ' 62563561 Fax: 6 6256 4315
Email: + sur@lkkauto.com

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Monday, 10 May 2021 4:35 PM 
To: simon@kkimhin.com.sg <simon@kkimhin.com.sg> 
Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: Re: YP 1262Z OD LONPAC DOA 30/04/2021
 
Dear Simon,

I have revert to Lonpac, yet to get authoriza�on. i will check with them and update you

Thanks and regards,
Denise
Case handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: ' 62563561 Fax: 6 6256 4315
Email: + sur@lkkauto.com

From: simon@kkimhin.com.sg <simon@kkimhin.com.sg> 
Sent: Monday, 10 May 2021 4:12 PM 
To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: YP 1262Z OD LONPAC DOA 30/04/2021
 
Dear Denise,
 
Vehicle had been surveyed by Kenneth on 07/05/2021.
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Would like you to update us when authorise repair.
Please advise.
 
Regards
Simon
 
 


