Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: June Yap <motorstopoffice@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 28 May 2021 10:30 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: Re: FBQ 5420A-DOA: 27/4/21

Good Morning Veron,

This is to confirm the Lump Sum finalization of $2200 / 4 repair Days.
Thank You and Stay Safe ©

*The above settlement is in respect of our client for damage pertaining to his motor vehicle and shall not
prejudice our client’s claim in respect of damages and consequential loss in relation to his personal
injuries.*

Cheers,

Yap June

Motor Stop Services Pte Ltd

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #01-07
Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore 415875
Telephone: 6385-1838
Fax : 6386-1838

On Thu, May 27, 2021 at 4:08 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen @lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Sir,

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Offer Lump Sum $2200 @ 4 days

Please check and confirmed



Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur @lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 1 S(408933)



