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Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

From: Maginet Plumbing Contractor <maginet8@yahoo.com>

Sent: Friday, 14 May 2021 11:03 AM

To: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 8528S & SJF 1138E ALONG/AT ST HILDA'S PRIMARY 

SCHOOL ON 30/04/2021

Jaslin 
 
Can you give me a call regarding this accident claim 
 
 

*All price quoted are subject to 7% GST 

Yours Sincerely, 
Sandy Pang 94385965 
 
OFF : 64654544 

 
 

Maginet Plumbing Contractor Pte Ltd 

No 30 Mandai Estate #02-09 
Mandai Industrial Building 
Singapore 729918 
(O) : 6465 4544 / 6465 0082 / 8128 3288 
(F) : 6365 5144 / 6893 1674  
(HP) : 9438 5965 / 9728 5144 
Account : 9178 7869 
 
email : maginet8@yahoo.com 
 
 
On Friday, May 14, 2021, 08:42:38 AM GMT+8, Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) <jaslinkok@lkkauto.com> wrote:  
 
 

Kindly ignore previous email. 
 

Our Ref: CC4/AIG21005393/Kra3 

  
MAGINET PLUMBING CONTRACTOR PTE LTD – BY EMAIL ONLY 

  
[POLICY HOLDER] 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
                                                       
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 8528S & SJF 1138E ALONG/AT ST HILDA'S PRIMARY 
SCHOOL ON 30/04/2021 

  
We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed 
by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against 
your policy. 
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We have received a claim from SJF 1138E against your motor insurance policy. 
  
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your driver's favor as your driver 
was reversing and collided with Third Party’s parked vehicle. Vehicle moving / reversing must 
exercise greater caution than parked vehicles. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable 
settlement with the Third Party. 
  
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, 
please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% 
for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has 
a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
   
Please call us if you have further queries. 
  
Yours faithfully, 
  
c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 

  
(Motor Claims Dept) 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Jaslin Kok (LKK Auto) 

Sent: Friday, May 14, 2021 8:41 AM 

To: MAGINET8@YAHOO.COM <MAGINET8@YAHOO.COM> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 8528S & SJF 1138E ALONG/AT ST HILDA'S PRIMARY SCHOOL ON 30/04/2021  

  

Our Ref: CC4/AIG21005393/Kra3 

  
MAGINET PLUMBING CONTRACTOR PTE LTD – BY EMAIL ONLY 

  
[POLICY HOLDER] 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
                                                       
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBE 8528S & SJF 1138E ALONG/AT ST HILDA'S PRIMARY 
SCHOOL ON 30/04/2021 
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We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed 
by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against 
your policy. 
  
We have received a claim from SJF 1138E against your motor insurance policy. 
  
Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your driver's favor as your driver 
was reversing and collided with Third Party’s parked vehicle. Vehicle moving / reversing must 
exercise greater caution than parked vehicles. We will therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable 
settlement with the Third Party. 
  
Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, 
please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% 
for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has 
a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected. 
  
Kindly assist to amend the accident date using attached addendum form, as the actual accident date 
is 02/05/2021. 
  
Please call us if you have further queries. 
  
  
Yours faithfully, 
  
  
c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd 

  
(Motor Claims Dept) 

  

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Jaslin Kok | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841 2157 | email: JaslinKok@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 


