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We appreciate your business and look forward to serve you again soon.

Xin Hua Workshop Pte Ltd

23 Kaki Bukit Ave 4
#04-01 (South Wing)
Singapore  415933
xinhuaworkshop@gmail.com
GST Registration No. : 201838521G

Tax Invoice
BILL TO
Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road,
07 The Concourse,
#17-04,
Singapore 199555.

INVOICE NO. XHW-INV-210244
DATE 28/10/2021

DUE DATE 28/10/2021
TERMS Due on receipt

  

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT

SMM 6200 C - Honda Shuttle
Date of Accident: 24/4/2021
Lump Sum Repair for Third Party Claim

2,500.00

 

All cheque payments should be crossed and made payable to "XIN 
HUA WORKSHOP PTE LTD"
Please indicate the invoice no. on the reverse side

SUBTOTAL 2,500.00
GST TOTAL 175.00
TOTAL 2,675.00
BALANCE DUE S$2,675.00
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Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 27 October 2021 12:36 pm
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)
Cc: MT_Claim_SG
Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM6200C & GW3328G ALONG JOO CHIAT RD BESIDE 

JOOT CHIAT COMPLEX  LKK REF : CC4/LPC21005349/gs3 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - General 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
Please proceed as proposed. 
 
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

 
 
“In view of the revised measures for COVID-19 restrictions effective 27 September 
2021, more than 50% of our staff will be working from home. Please expect delays in 
our replies, payments and claims settlements during this period. Your understanding 
is greatly appreciated and we apologise for any inconvenience caused”. 
 
 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: CHEW BENG KEE <bkchew@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 27 October 2021 12:27 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM6200C & GW3328G ALONG JOO CHIAT RD BESIDE JOOT CHIAT COMPLEX LKK 
REF : CC4/LPC21005349/gs3 [External Confidential] 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential 



2

 
Hi Gerald 
 
OK, pls proceed with TPPD claims settlement as proposed. 
Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards 
Mr Chew Beng Kee 
Head of Claims | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 246 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 
 
In view of the revised measures for transition under Phase 2 COVID-19 restrictions effective 
27 September 2021 (Internal), 50% of our staff will be working from home. Please expect 
delays in our replies, payments and claims settlements during this period. Your understanding 
is greatly appreciated and we apologise for any inconvenience caused. 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 
 
From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 27 October 2021 9:31 am 
To: CHEW BENG KEE <bkchew@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: FW: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM6200C & GW3328G ALONG JOO CHIAT RD BESIDE JOOT CHIAT COMPLEX LKK 
REF : CC4/LPC21005349/gs3 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
 
Hi Chew, 
 
Attached supporting documents for DS for your approval. 
 
Thank you.  
 
Best Regards 
 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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“In view of the revised measures for COVID-19 restrictions effective 27 September 
2021, more than 50% of our staff will be working from home. Please expect delays in 
our replies, payments and claims settlements during this period. Your understanding 
is greatly appreciated and we apologise for any inconvenience caused”. 
 
 
 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, 26 October 2021 7:00 pm 
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM6200C & GW3328G ALONG JOO CHIAT RD BESIDE JOOT CHIAT COMPLEX LKK 
REF : CC4/LPC21005349/gs3 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac Ref: 20/21/21/VC05/024495 

LKK Ref: CC4/LPC21005349/gs3 

  

Dear Sirs/Madam, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We have highlighted to your good office on 03/05/2021 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our 
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

  

This is a case of BOLA S15. Liability is not in our driver’s favour. 

  

Summary to offer to third party repairer, “XIN HUA WORKSHOP PTE LTD” is as follows: - 

  

  Claimed Amount Revised Amount 
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 11,570.21 $ 2,675.00 
2. Loss of rental (4days x $120.00) $      480.00 $    400.00 (4days x $100.00) 
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee $          7.45 $        7.45 

Total $ 12,057.66 $ 3,082.45 
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**04days recommendation for repair 

  

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference. 

  

The above is for your approval. 

 

 
 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence 

should be made via email.  Submission of claim related documents will be 

in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
 
Best Regards, 

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

 
 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  
Sent: Thursday, 14 October 2021 6:55 am 
To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SMM6200C & GW3328G ALONG JOO CHIAT RD BESIDE JOOT CHIAT COMPLEX LKK 
REF : CC4/LPC21005349/gs3 [External Confidential] 
 

Lonpac External - General 
 
 
Our Ref: 20/21/21/VC05/024495 
 
Dear Cecilia, 
 
Please proceed with DS. 
 


