Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 6 May 2021 3:31 PM

To: 'Claims’; '"Wai Yin Ng'

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto); Jasmine Tan
Subject: RE: AAD2104-125 FINALISE --SHC5154X

Dear Amanda,

Thank you

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 6 May 2021 3:30 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; 'Wai Yin Ng' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>; Jasmine Tan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; Claims
<claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: AAD2104-125 FINALISE --SHC5154X

Dear Denise
| have check with Jasmine. She agreed on the repair limit $3,200.00.

Therefore, we shall confirm the amount at $3,200.00 (before GST)

Thank you.
Best Regards

Amanda
Claims Department

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) [mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, May 06, 2021 8:41 AM

To: 'Wai Yin Ng' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SHC5154X

Hi,



Any confirmation?

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 3 May 2021 4:59 PM

To: 'Wai Yin Ng' <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>
Subject: SHC5154X

Dear Wai Yin,

Max at $3200 lump sum.

Please check and confirm

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



