Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 August 2021 9:49 AM
To: Kelvin Ng

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FBF 9969R

Hi Grace,

Thanks noted

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Kelvin Ng [mailto:cckmotor@yahoo.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 17 August, 2021 9:46 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Cc: Kelvin Ng

Subject: Re: FBF 9969R

Dear Rasul
We accepted offer of $2600 / 4 days of lump sum repair.

Best regards
Grace

On Monday, August 16, 2021, 03:48:07 PM GMT+8, Rasul (LKKAuto) <rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,

As per our conversation, I've already check with my side that 20% after total amount will be counted out instead we
adjusted it to 10% after the total amount that is $2,600 / 4 days of lump sum repair

Kindly confirm the amount



Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 August, 2021 12:48 PM
To: cckmotor@yahoo.com

Subject: FBF 9969R

Hi,

kindly refer to attachment for the finalised amount.
Finalised amount is $ 2,300 / 4 days of lump sum repair

Kindly confirm and reply to me once agreed

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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