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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 15 June 2021 3:21 pm

To: 2020 SPRAYPAINTING; SUR

Subject: RE: FINALISATION CONFIRMATION ON SMX4336A.

Dear Shah, 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Confirm final fig $3,612.48 and 4 repair days. 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 15 June 2021 3:10 pm 

To: 2020 SPRAYPAINTING <2020spraypainting@gmail.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: FINALISATION CONFIRMATION ON SMX4336A. 

 
Dear Shah, 

 

This case handle by Shiau Chan. 

 

 

Dear Shiau Chan 

 

Kindly assist. 

 
 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 
 

From: 2020 SPRAYPAINTING [mailto:2020spraypainting@gmail.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 15 June 2021 3:05 PM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FINALISATION CONFIRMATION ON SMX4336A. 
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 Hi Veron, 

 

How about the finalisation confirmation of this vehicle. Has Adrian updated you? 

 

 -- 

Thank You. 

Regards, 

SHAH  

Admin of 

2020 SPRAY PAINTING PTE LTD. 

H/p: 97166502 

Email: 2020spraypainting@gmail.com 


