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Re: Accident involving SMD2845R& GBC6618P ON 26/04/2021 Your
Ref:CC4/AIG21005253/Apa3

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Wed 7/7/2021 4:38 PM
To:  Tyson Koh <tysonkoh@skauto.com.sg>
Cc:  SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg>; Simon Koh <simon@skauto.com.sg>; Joanne Chua <Joanne@skauto.com.sg>

1 attachments (190 KB)
DV_SMD 2845R.pdf;

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tyson Koh <tysonkoh@skauto.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 6 July 2021 3:06 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg>; Simon Koh <simon@skauto.com.sg>; Joanne Chua
<Joanne@skauto.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SMD2845R& GBC6618P ON 26/04/2021 Your Ref:CC4/AIG21005253/Apa3
 
Dear Hsiao Tong,

Thank you for your offer, I accept $4,240.00(all-in).

Thank you for everything

Tyson Koh
HP: 93827852 (24HRS)
This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you

have received this email in error please notify SK Automobile Pte Ltd. This message contains confidential information and is intended only for the

individual named. If you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender immediately

by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you are notified that

disclosing, copying, distributing or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited.
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On Tue, Jul 6, 2021 at 2:55 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice


Dear Sirs/Mdm,


We refer to your below email.


We are prepared to revise our offer at a global sum of $4,240.00(all-in).


Please confirm acceptance.


“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on

the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Tyson Koh <tysonkoh@skauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 1 July 2021 5:09 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg>; Simon Koh <simon@skauto.com.sg>; Joanne Chua
<Joanne@skauto.com.sg>

Subject: Re: Accident involving SMD2845R& GBC6618P ON 26/04/2021 Your Ref:CC4/AIG21005253/Apa3
 
Dear Hsiao Tong,


Thank you for your offer. May I appeal to you for my rental is Cat B, new vehicle. 


May I ask if we can settle at  $4,390.00(all-in).


Thank you for everything

Tyson Koh
HP: 93827852 (24HRS)
This email and any files transmitted with it are confidential and intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If

you have received this email in error please notify SK Automobile Pte Ltd. This message contains confidential information and is intended only for

the individual named. If you are not the named addressee you should not disseminate, distribute or copy this e-mail. Please notify the sender

immediately by e-mail if you have received this e-mail by mistake and delete this e-mail from your system. If you are not the intended recipient you

are notified that disclosing, copying, distributing or taking any action in reliance on the contents of this information is strictly prohibited.





On Wed, Jun 30, 2021 at 5:46 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:
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Without Prejudice
 
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
We propose settlement at a global sum of $4,140.00(all-in).
 
Please confirm acceptance.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole

intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,

whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence

on the issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 24 June 2021 10:23 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Simon Koh <simon@skauto.com.sg>; Tyson Koh <tysonkoh@skauto.com.sg>

Subject: Fwd: Accident involving SMD2845R& GBC6618P ON 26/04/2021 Your
Ref:CC4/AIG21005253/Apa3
 
Dear Hsiao Tong,

Thanks for your email

Kindly refer to attached doc for your reference

Regards,
Huey Lee
SK Automobile Pte Ltd

---------- Forwarded message ---------

From: SK Admin <admin@skauto.com.sg>

Date: Tue, Jun 1, 2021 at 3:55 PM

Subject: Accident involving SMD2845R& GBC6618P ON 26/04/2021

To: ClaimsAdmin <ClaimsAdminSupport@aig.com>

Cc: Simon Koh <simon@skauto.com.sg>, Tyson Koh <tysonkoh@skauto.com.sg>
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Dear Sir / Mdm,

Enclose the final bill & relevant documents for your perusal. 
Kindly refer to the attachment and revert back to us soon.

Breakdown as below:
Cost of repair : S$    3,638.00 (incl' GST 7%)
Loss of rental : S$    1,070.00 (05 days @ S$214.00)
LTA Search    : S$           2.00
Total               : S$    4,710.00

We appreciate your early reply .

Thanks for your kind attention.

--
Regards,

Huey Lee
SK Automobile Pte Ltd


