Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:

Sent:

To:

Subject:
Attachments:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Tuesday, 23 August 2022 3:08 PM

‘Guan Motor Works'

RE: Guan Motor Works - Settlement for SKZ 8405 X
DS FORM_SKZ8405X.pdf

We confirm settlement at a global sum of $4,000.00(all-in).

Please duly sign the documents enclosed and return together with your client’s authorization to act to us (LKK) for

our necessary action.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 5 August 2022 10:46 AM
To: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: Guan Motor Works - Settlement for SKZ 8405 X

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We have sought further mandate from AXA.

We are prepared to revise our offer at a global sum of $4,000.00(all-in).

Please confirm acceptance.



“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 29 June 2022 10:40 AM

To: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: Guan Motor Works - Settlement for SKZ 8405 X

REMINDER

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/mdm,
We refer to your below email.

We have further appealed your matter to our principal for further review. However, we regret to inform you that we
have our principal instruction to maintain our offer at g/s $3,800.00(all-in).

Please re-consider our offer. Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 29 April 2022 12:49 PM

To: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>
Subject: RE: Guan Motor Works - Settlement for SKZ 8405 X

Without Prejudice
(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/mdm,
We refer to your below email.

We have further appealed your matter to our principal for further review. However, we regret to inform you that we
have our principal instruction to maintain our offer at g/s $3,800.00(all-in).

Please re-consider our offer. Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |

S(408933)

From: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 31 March 2022 4:22 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Guan Motor Works - Settlement for SKZ 8405 X




Hi Miss Hsiao Tong,
We counter propose Global sum at SS 6,456 .
Thank you.

Pang
Guan Motor Works

On Tue, Mar 29, 2022 at 12:04 PM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@I|kkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/mdm,

Attached is a copy of document from AXA to show that your client insurer had settled 50/50 with AXA.

Please re-consider our offer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)

From: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, 9 December 2021 5:30 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Guan Motor Works - Settlement for SKZ 8405 X
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Hi Hsiao Tong,

We checked with our client and didn't receive claim from the other party.

Thank you.

Pang

Guan Motor Works

On Tue, Aug 31, 2021 at 10:53 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

(save as to costs)

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to your below email.

We have appealed your matter to our principal for further review. However, we regret to inform you that we
maintain offer at a global sum of $3,800.00(all-in).

The video cannot how clearly when at the bend. Our insured vehicle is still within his lane after the bend then
collision happen. Furthermore, your client's insurer had accepted AXA Subrogation claim at 50%.

Kindly re-consider our offer. Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed /
inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”



Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, 19 July 2021 2:59 pm

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Guan Motor Works - Settlement for SKZ 8405 X

Hi Hsiao Tong,

We do not accept the offer.

We have scene photos and video as supporting evidence.

It shows that our client (SKZ 8405 X) is still within his own lane.

After the accident, our client's vehicle (SKZ 8405 X) stopped. The
scene photos were taken directly.

Thank you.
Pang
Guan Motor Works

On 7/15/21, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:
> Without Prejudice

>

> Dear Sirs/Mdm,

>

> We refer to the above matter.

>

> We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of

> $3,800.00(all-in) as both parties were negotiating a bend.

>

> Please confirm acceptance.

>

>

> “Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely
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> on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving the matter
> amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of

> liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of
> terms/settlement.

>

> In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by
> either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of

> liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
> terms/settlement.”

>

>

> Best Regards,

> Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

> LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

> Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@Ikkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108

> HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

> From: Guan Motor Works <guanmotorworks@gmail.com>
> Sent: Monday, 12 July 2021 5:27 PM

> To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

> Subject: Guan Motor Works - Settlement for SKZ 8405 X

>

> Hi Hsiao Tong,

>

> See attached. Total - 5 pieces.

>

> -

> Yours sincerely,

>

> Pang

> Operations

>

> Guan Motor Works

>

> 176 Sin Ming Drive

> #02-03 Sin Ming Autocare

> Singapore 575721

> 0:+65.64536.111

> F: +65.6453.8292

> WWW.EMW.com.sg

>
> This transmission is CONFIDENTIAL and the information is intended only for
> the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. If you are not

> the intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering
> it to the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use,

> dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is STRICTLY

> PROHIBITED. If you have received the transmission in error, please

> immediately notify us by e-mail and/or telephone, and delete the

> transmission and any attachments from your mailbox. Thank you.

>




Yours sincerely,

Pang
Operations

Guan Motor Works

176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-03 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore 575721

0: +65.64536.111

F: +65.6453.8292
WWW.EMW.COm.sg

This transmission is CONFIDENTIAL and the information is intended only for
the

use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. If you are not the
intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering it
to

the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination,
distribution or copying of this communication is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If
you

have received the transmission in error, please immediately notify us by
e-mail

and/or telephone, and delete the transmission and any attachments from your
mailbox. Thank you.

Yours sincerely,

Pang
Operations

Guan Motor Works

176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-03 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore 575721

0O: +65.64536.111

F: +65.6453.8292
WWW.EMW.COm.sg

This transmission is CONFIDENTIAL and the information is intended only for the
use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. If you are not the
intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering it to
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination,
distribution or copying of this communication is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If you
have received the transmission in error, please immediately notify us by e-mail
and/or telephone, and delete the transmission and any attachments from your
mailbox. Thank you.



Yours sincerely,

Pang
Operations

Guan Motor Works

176 Sin Ming Drive
#02-03 Sin Ming Autocare
Singapore 575721

0: +65.64536.111

F: +65.6453.8292
WWW.EMW.COm.sg

This transmission is CONFIDENTIAL and the information is intended only for the
use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. If you are not the
intended recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering it to
the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination,
distribution or copying of this communication is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. If you
have received the transmission in error, please immediately notify us by e-mail
and/or telephone, and delete the transmission and any attachments from your
mailbox. Thank you.



