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Re: SDT 172J DOA: 24/04/2021

Accord Auto(Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>
Thu 17/6/2021 11:21 AM
To:  Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Dear Dennis, 

We would confirm acceptance Lump Sum: $1700 (before GST)/ 2 day 

Thank you.

Kind regards,

Jacqueline   

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd

10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A

#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point 

Singapore 568047

Mobile : (65) 9740 0999

Tel      : (65) 6481 9517

Fax     : (65) 6481 9516


This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view, disseminate,
use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your system. Thank
you.


On Thu, 17 Jun 2021 at 09:19, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Jacqueline,


Any updates on confirmation? 


Lump sum $1700 , 2 working days



Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 16 June 2021 11:18 AM

To: Accord Auto(Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>

Subject: RE: SDT 172J DOA: 24/04/2021
 

Hi Jacqueline,

 

Lump sum $1700 , 2 working days.
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Please check and confirm

 

 

 

 

 

 

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

From: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) 

Sent: Wednesday, 16 June 2021 11:15 AM

To: Kenneth Kong (LKKAuto) <KennethKong@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Accord Auto(Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg>

Subject: FW: SDT 172J DOA: 24/04/2021

 

 

Hi Kenneth,

 

Finalise please

 

 

 

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com
mailto:KennethKong@lkkauto.com
mailto:claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg


6/17/2021 Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

https://outlook.office.com/mail/deeplink?popoutv2=1&version=20210607004.08 3/4

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

 

From: Accord Auto(Claims) <claims@mycarworkshop.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 16 June 2021 11:05 AM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: SDT 172J DOA: 24/04/2021

 

Hi Denise, 

 

Kindly see file attached for after repair photo. 

Kindly confirm the repair amount & number of days. 

 



Thank you.



Kind regards,

Jacqueline    

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd

10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A

#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point 

Singapore 568047



Mobile : (65) 9740 0999

Tel      : (65) 6481 9517

Fax     : (65) 6481 9516

 

This email is confidential and privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not view,
disseminate, use or copy this email. Kindly notify the sender immediately, and delete this email from your
system. Thank you.

 

 

On Mon, 14 Jun 2021 at 15:42, Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi,
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Just want to follow up on repair status. if the repair is done? can finalise?

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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