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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Steve Chen (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 June 2021 9:33 PM

To: Ho Yue Meng

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: Photos before paint and Finalised Bill for SKV9649Z

Attachments: SKV 9649 main estimate.pdf; FINALISED - SKV9649Z.pdf

HI Mr Ho, 

 

We confirm the finalize $1345.28 (P/P, before GST). 3 repair days. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thanks. 

 
Best Regards, 
Steve Chen| Automotive Assessor 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 81117723/6256-3561 | email: stevenfoong@lkkauto.com| fax: 6256-4315 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Ho Yue Meng <ho_yue_meng@tanchong.com> 

Sent: Thursday, 10 June 2021 3:29 PM 

To: Steve Chen (LKK Auto) <SteveChen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Photos before paint and Finalised Bill for SKV9649Z  
  
Dear Sir, 
  

Please find attached photos before paint for SKV9649Z. 
  
Also, please find attached finalised bill for SKV9649Z. 
  
  
Total Repair Days : 3 Days 

  
Thank-you. 

  
  
Best Regards 
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YM Ho 
TC Autoclinic Pte Ltd 

No 1 Sixth Lok Yang Road 
Singapore 628099 

DID : 67038432 

  


