4/26/2021 Mail - Su Li (LKK Auto) - Outlook

RE: DIRECT SETTLEMENT: Pre-Repair Notification - Accident Involving GBE2580D &
XE8558U (Yr Insured) on 15/04/2021. [External Confidential]

Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Mon 4/26/2021 9:43 AM
To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Dear Sir / Mdm,

Thank you for your assignment.

Best Regards,

Summer Lee | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi
Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of
claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 April, 2021 7:17 AM

To: 'assignments@Ikkauto.com' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; 'cuiping@carway.com.sg' <cuiping@carway.com.sg>

Subject: FW: DIRECT SETTLEMENT: Pre-Repair Notification - Accident Involving GBE2580D & XE8558U (Yr Insured)
on 15/04/2021. [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential

Our Ref: TBA

Dear Nvitha/Summer,

FYA. Our insured has not lodged the GIA report.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
=T
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: CuiPing (Ms Lee) [mailto:cuiping@carway.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 23 April 2021 5:06 pm

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: Re: DIRECT SETTLEMENT: Pre-Repair Notification - Accident Involving GBE2580D & XE8558U (Yr Insured)
on 15/04/2021. [External Confidential]

Dear Sir,

We have no objection to appoint surveyors from LKK to conduct the surveys.

Please assist us to assign the soonest possible.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

4 CuiPing (Ms Lee) ¢

WWW.carway.com.sg

Office: (+65) 6744 0777 | Fax: (+65) 6744 2377 | Mobile: (+65) 8588 0777

Main Office Address: 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #03-01 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408934
Showroom Address: 61 Ubi Avenue 2 #05-09 Automobile Megamart, Singapore 408898
Workshop Address: 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #03-01 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408934
Disclaimer: This e-mail may contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of recipient(s)

named herein. If you have received this message in error, please delete all copies of it and notify us immediately.
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On 2021-04-23 14:32, GERALD POH WEE BIN wrote:
Lonpac External - Confidential

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Our Ref : TBA

Dear Cui Ping,

We intend to conduct a pre-repair survey of your client's vehicle and append below our list of Motor
surveyors for your attention:-

Nicholas Tey—-Appraisal
Jackson Quek - Appraisal
Joshua Ong - Appraisal
Steve Chen- LKK

Adrian Ling - LKK
Kenneth Kong - LKK
Qing Quo Xiang- LKK

Oi Sun Pin - LKK

Mohd Rasul -LKK

Marcus Chua - LKK
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Please let us hear from you within the next 2 working days.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt
practices.

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.
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From: CuiPing (Ms Lee) [mailto:cuiping@carway.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 23 April 2021 2:10 pm

To: Customer SG <customer_sg@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: DIRECT SETTLEMENT: Pre-Repair Notification - Accident Involving GBE2580D & XE8558U (Yr Insured) on
15/04/2021.

Dear Sirs,

Attached herewith the Pre Repair Notification.

As per NIMA Protocol, please assist to provide list of surveyors for assignment if you wish to
conduct the pre-repair survey within 2 working days.

We proposed Direct Settlement.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

4 CuiPing (Ms Lee) ¢

wWww.carway.com.sg
Office: (+65) 6744 0777 | Fax: (+65) 6744 2377 | Mobile: (+65) 8588 0777

Main Office Address: 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #03-01 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408934
Showroom Address: 61 Ubi Avenue 2 #05-09 Automobile Megamart, Singapore 408898
Workshop Address: 53 Ubi Avenue 1 #03-01 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408934

Disclaimer: This e-mail may contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of

recipient(s) named herein. If you have received this message in error, please delete all copies of it and notify us
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immediately.
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