Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 May 2022 9:25 AM

To: Uma kant Tiwari

Subject: RE: [Reminder] - Ref CC4/AIG21005120/NPA3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC
754L(AIG) AND SHD 1485L ON 22/04/2021]

Attachments: Private_Settlement_From(SKC754L).pdf

URGENT REMINDER

Hi Mr Tiwari Uma Kant,

Please be informed that third party repairer has yet received payment from your end.

Kindly let us have the transaction/ payment advice for this matter.

If you have paid $1,070.00 to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD. Please assist to resign on the attached
private settlement form and return to us for our necessary action.

1. $1,070.00 payable to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

You may send the payment via internal banking as per below details:

Account name: Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd
Bank Name: DBS Bank Ltd
Bank Code: 7171
Branch Code: 003
Account No: 0039052367
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 3 May 2022 11:59 AM

To: Uma kant Tiwari <utiwari37 @yahoo.com>

Subject: RE: [Reminder] - Ref CC4/A1G21005120/NPA3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC 754L(AIG) AND SHD 1485L ON
22/04/2021]



URGENT

Hi Mr Tiwari Uma Kant,

Kindly let us have the transaction/ payment advice for this matter.

If you have paid $1,070.00 to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD. Please assist to resign on the attached
private settlement form and return to us for our necessary action.

1. $1,070.00 payable to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

You may send the payment via internal banking as per below details:

Account name: Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd
Bank Name: DBS Bank Ltd

Bank Code: 7171

Branch Code: 003

Account No: 0039052367

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: -

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 1 April 2022 5:47 pm

To: Uma kant Tiwari <utiwari37@yahoo.com>

Subject: RE: [Reminder] - Ref CC4/AIG21005120/NPA3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC 754L(AIG) AND SHD 1485L ON
22/04/2021]

REMINDER

Hi Mr Tiwari Uma Kant,

Kindly let us have the transaction/ payment advice for this matter.

If you have paid $1,070.00 to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD. Please assist to resign on the attached
private settlement form and return to us for our necessary action.

1. $1,070.00 payable to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

You may send the payment via internal banking as per below details:

Account name: Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd
Bank Name: DBS Bank Ltd

Bank Code: 7171

Branch Code: 003

Account No: 0039052367



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 18 March 2022 9:26 AM

To: Uma kant Tiwari <utiwari37 @yahoo.com>

Subject: RE: [Reminder] - Ref CC4/AIG21005120/NPA3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC 754L(AIG) AND SHD 1485L ON
22/04/2021]

REMINDER

Hi Mr Tiwari Uma Kant,

Thank you for your email dated 17/02/2022.

Kindly let us have the transaction/ payment advice for this matter.

If you have paid $1,070.00 to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD. Please assist to resign on the attached
private settlement form and return to us for our necessary action.

1. $1,070.00 payable to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

You may send the payment via internal banking as per below details:

Account name: Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd
Bank Name: DBS Bank Ltd

Bank Code: 7171

Branch Code: 003

Account No: 0039052367



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 21 February 2022 5:31 PM

To: Uma kant Tiwari <utiwari37 @yahoo.com>

Subject: RE: [Reminder] - Ref CC4/A1G21005120/NPA3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC 754L(AIG) AND SHD 1485L ON
22/04/2021]

Hi Mr Tiwari Uma Kant,

Thank you for your email dated 17/02/2022.

Kindly let us have the transaction/ payment advice for this matter.

If you have paid $1,070.00 to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD. Please assist to resign on the attached
private settlement form and return to us for our necessary action.

1. $1,070.00 payable to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD

You may send the payment via internal banking as per below details:

Account name: Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd
Bank Name: DBS Bank Ltd
Bank Code: 7171
Branch Code: 003
Account No: 0039052367
Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)




From: Uma kant Tiwari <utiwari37@yahoo.com>

Sent: Thursday, 17 February 2022 3:05 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: [Reminder] - Ref CC4/AIG21005120/NPA3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC 754L(AIG) AND SHD 1485L ON

22/04/2021]

Hi sir
Please find TT copy . Another TT copy Inwlll share
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Tiwari Uma kant
Sent from my iPhone

On 17-Feb-2022, at 13:56, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Reminder

Hi Mr Tiwari Uma Kant,

We refer to our email dated 09/02/2022.

Kindly let us have the transaction/ payment advice for this matter.

If you have paid $1,070.00 to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD. Please assist to resign on

the attached private settlement form and return to us for our necessary action.

1. $1,070.00 payable to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
2. $ 365.94 payable to LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

You may send the payment via internal banking as per below details:

Account name: Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Bank Name: DBS Bank Ltd
Bank Code: 7171

Branch Code: 003

Account No: 0039052367

Name of Bank Account

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Name of Bank

uosB

Bank — Branch No.

7375 -016

Account No.

116-311-126-3

Email address for remittance advice

account@Ilkkauto.com

PAYNOW ID

199607198R002

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.
Submission of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much
regretted.



Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: -

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 9 February 2022 9:55 am

To: Uma kant Tiwari <utiwari37 @yahoo.com>

Subject: FW: Ref CC4/A1G21005120/NPA3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC 754L(AIG) AND SHD 1485L ON

22/04/2021]
Hi Mr Tiwari Uma Kant,

Thank you for your email.

Kindly let us have the transaction/ payment advice for this matter.

If you have paid $1,070.00 to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD. Please assist to resign on

the attached private settlement form and return to us for our necessary action.

1. $1,070.00 payable to PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
2. $ 365.94 payable to LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

You may send the payment via internal banking as per below details:

Account name:

Bank Name: DBS Bank Ltd
Bank Code: 7171

Branch Code: 003

Account No: 0039052367

Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

Name of Bank Account

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Name of Bank

uosB

Bank — Branch No.

7375 -016

Account No.

116-311-126-3

Email address for remittance advice

account@Ilkkauto.com

PAYNOW ID

199607198R002




Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)

From: Uma kant Tiwari <utiwari37@yahoo.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 8 February 2022 10:20 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Re: Ref CC4/AIG21005120/NPA3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKC 754L(AIG) AND SHD 1485L ON
22/04/2021]

Dear Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms)

I have paid both the amount

Please find the mutual settle meant for
regards

Uma kant Tiwari

On 23 Dec 2021, at 2:07 PM, Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms)



