Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 12 July 2021 4:50 pm

To: Rasul (LKKAuto); Thomas Pang PTCBC
Subject: RE: Finalize Report SLX2656B

Dear Thomas,

Confirm final fig $11,917.91 before excess $500.00 & GST and 7 repair days.
Kindly send the relevant documents to MSIG Insurance company.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25
| S(408933)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ilkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 5 July 2021 9:51 am

To: Thomas Pang PTCBC <Thomas.Pang@borneomotors.com.sg>
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Finalize Report SLX2656B

Hi Thomas,

Take note the finalised amount NOT confirm yet. As this is MSIG case required to get mandate or approval

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-
25 | S(408933) Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 July, 2021 9:46 AM
To: 'Thomas Pang PTCBC'

Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Finalize Report SLX2656B

Hi Thomas,

Finalised amount of $ 11, 917.91 BEFORE excess / 7 days of repair is confirmed

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-
25 | S(408933) Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

From: Thomas Pang PTCBC [mailto:Thomas.Pang@borneomotors.com.sg]
Sent: Saturday, 3 July, 2021 11:36 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Finalize Report SLX2656B
resend

From: Thomas Pang PTCBC

Sent: Wednesday, 5 May 2021 1:34 pm
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Finalize Report SLX2656B

Hi Rasul,

Attach finalize report for your perusal.
Thank you

Regards

Thomas pang



