6/17/2021 Mail - Denise Tay (LKKAuto) - Outlook

Re: Finalize Report SMV9422L

Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>
Thu 17/6/2021 1:53 PM

To: Thomas Pang PTCBC <Thomas.Pang@borneomotors.com.sg>
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Dear Thomas,
Confirm final figure at $6,219.23 before Excess and GST with 7 working days
Please submit your relevant documents to MSIG directly.

Best Regards,

Denise Tay | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: denisetay@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 May 2021 3:10 PM

To: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Finalize Report SMV9422L

From: Thomas Pang PTCBC <Thomas.Pang@borneomotors.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 May 2021 3:09:55 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore
To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Finalize Report SMV9422L

Dear Rasul,

Attach finalize report for your perusal.

Thank you

Regards

Thomas pang

https://outlook.office.com/mail/inbox/id/AAQKAGNIMTQ10ODBhLTcONjYtNGE3OCOSNWVKLTMyZWUwMGFhNWIXNAAQAGIOqiLUKkGekoWadg4... 1/1


mailto:denisetay@lkkauto.com

